

BID TABULATION

Bid No. BLD2114787BX (extended interim)
 Chilled Water Systems Maintenance and Repairs
 Agencies: Facility Management Division
 Purchasing Agent: Jeannette Ferrell



Tabulation of Bids				Dalkin Applied Americas Inc. 15712 SW 41 St., Suite 6 Davie, FL 33331		Voluntary Price Reduction Offer		Johnson Controls, Inc. 15901 SW 29 St., Suite 801 Miramar, FL 33026		Voluntary Price Reduction Offer	
Item	Commodity Code Description	Qty	Unit	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Interim 6-Month Total	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Interim 6-Month Total
Group 1 - North Territory (Items 01-01 through 01-24)											
01-01	Government Center	6	MTH	\$5,665.000	\$ 33,990.00	\$ 5,495.00	\$ 32,970.00	No Bid	\$ -		
01-02	Government Center Annex	6	MTH	\$3,890.000	\$ 23,340.00	\$ 3,773.00	\$ 22,638.00	No Bid	\$ -		
01-03	Main Library	6	MTH	\$4,669.000	\$ 28,014.00	\$ 4,528.93	\$ 27,173.58	No Bid	\$ -		
01-04	Ft. Lauderdale Library	6	MTH	\$2,063.000	\$ 12,378.00	\$ 2,001.11	\$ 12,006.66	No Bid	\$ -		
01-05	Central Homeless Assistance Center	6	MTH	\$2,216.000	\$ 13,296.00	\$ 2,149.52	\$ 12,897.12	No Bid	\$ -		
01-06	North Regional Courthouse	6	MTH	\$5,377.000	\$ 32,262.00	\$ 5,215.69	\$ 31,294.14	No Bid	\$ -		
01-07	Northwest Branch Library	6	MTH	\$1,691.000	\$ 10,146.00	\$ 1,640.27	\$ 9,841.62	No Bid	\$ -		
01-08	Northwest Regional Library	6	MTH	\$2,771.000	\$ 16,626.00	\$ 2,687.87	\$ 16,127.22	No Bid	\$ -		
01-09	Margate Library	6	MTH	\$1,654.000	\$ 9,924.00	\$ 1,604.38	\$ 9,626.28	No Bid	\$ -		
01-10	Tamarac Library	6	MTH	\$1,692.000	\$ 10,152.00	\$ 1,641.24	\$ 9,847.44	No Bid	\$ -		
01-11	Public Safety Building	6	MTH	\$6,033.000	\$ 36,198.00	\$ 5,852.01	\$ 35,112.06	No Bid	\$ -		
01-12	African American Library	6	MTH	\$1,476.000	\$ 8,856.00	\$ 1,431.72	\$ 8,590.32	No Bid	\$ -		
01-13	Edgar P Mills Multi-Purpose Center	6	MTH	\$2,992.000	\$ 17,952.00	\$ 2,902.24	\$ 17,413.44	No Bid	\$ -		
01-14	Central Broward Regional Park	6	MTH	\$1,709.000	\$ 10,254.00	\$ 1,657.73	\$ 9,946.38	No Bid	\$ -		
01-15	North Mass Transit - Bldg 2	6	MTH	\$1,797.000	\$ 10,782.00	\$ 1,743.09	\$ 10,458.54	No Bid	\$ -		
01-16	North Mass Transit - Bldg 3	6	MTH	\$1,935.000	\$ 11,610.00	\$ 1,876.95	\$ 11,261.70	No Bid	\$ -		
01-17	North Mass Transit - Bldg 4	6	MTH	\$2,260.000	\$ 13,560.00	\$ 2,192.20	\$ 13,153.20	No Bid	\$ -		
01-18	Traffic Engineering	6	MTH	\$2,361.000	\$ 14,166.00	\$ 2,290.17	\$ 13,741.02	No Bid	\$ -		
01-19	Lauderdale Lakes Library	6	MTH	\$1,933.000	\$ 11,598.00	\$ 1,875.01	\$ 11,250.06	No Bid	\$ -		
01-20	Straight-time Hfry Rate - Field Mechanic/Technicians	300	HR	\$148.000	\$ 44,400.00	\$ 148.00	\$ 44,400.00	No Bid	\$ -		
01-21	Over-time Hfry Rate - Field Mechanic/Technicians	300	HR	\$222.000	\$ 66,600.00	\$ 222.00	\$ 66,600.00	No Bid	\$ -		
01-22	Straight-time Hfry Rate - Supervisor	300	HR	\$165.000	\$ 49,500.00	\$ 165.00	\$ 49,500.00	No Bid	\$ -		
01-23	Over-time Hfry Rate - Supervisor	300	HR	\$247.500	\$ 74,250.00	\$ 247.50	\$ 74,250.00	No Bid	\$ -		
01-24	Allowance	107,000	EA	\$1.000	\$ 107,000.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 107,000.00	No Bid	\$ -		
Group 1 Total					\$ 666,854.00		\$ 657,098.78		\$ 480,299.00		\$ 432,536.75
Group 2 - South Territory (Items 02-01 through 02-20)											
02-01	Midrise	6	MTH	\$1,937.000	\$ 11,622.00			\$1,333.000	\$ 7,998.00	\$ 999.75	\$ 5,998.50
02-02	North Wing	6	MTH	\$5,211.000	\$ 31,266.00			\$6,660.000	\$ 39,960.00	\$ 4,985.00	\$ 29,970.00
02-03	BARC	6	MTH	\$1,936.000	\$ 11,616.00			\$1,038.000	\$ 6,228.00	\$ 778.50	\$ 4,671.00
02-04	Broward County HRS Ft. Lauderdale PHC	6	MTH	\$3,084.000	\$ 18,504.00			\$1,505.000	\$ 9,030.00	\$ 1,128.75	\$ 6,772.50
02-05	West Regional Courthouse	6	MTH	\$4,316.000	\$ 25,896.00			\$3,089.000	\$ 18,534.00	\$ 2,316.75	\$ 13,900.50
02-06	West Regional Library	6	MTH	\$3,599.000	\$ 21,594.00			\$3,525.000	\$ 21,150.00	\$ 2,643.75	\$ 15,862.50
02-07	Emergency Operations Center (EOC)	6	MTH	\$1,586.000	\$ 9,516.00			\$932.500	\$ 5,595.00	\$ 699.38	\$ 4,196.25
02-08	Broward County Government Center West	6	MTH	\$3,954.000	\$ 23,724.00			\$3,753.000	\$ 22,518.00	\$ 2,814.75	\$ 16,888.50
02-09	South Regional Courthouse	6	MTH	\$3,717.000	\$ 22,302.00			\$2,788.000	\$ 16,728.00	\$ 2,091.00	\$ 12,546.00
02-10	South Regional Health Center	6	MTH	\$2,195.000	\$ 13,170.00			\$1,429.000	\$ 8,574.00	\$ 1,071.75	\$ 6,430.50
02-11	Young At Art	6	MTH	\$2,012.000	\$ 12,072.00			\$1,065.000	\$ 6,390.00	\$ 798.75	\$ 4,792.50
02-12	Weston Library	6	MTH	\$2,011.000	\$ 12,066.00			\$1,065.000	\$ 6,390.00	\$ 798.75	\$ 4,792.50
02-13	Hollywood Library	6	MTH	\$1,801.000	\$ 10,806.00			\$1,065.000	\$ 6,390.00	\$ 798.75	\$ 4,792.50
02-14	South Mass Transit	6	MTH	\$1,887.000	\$ 11,322.00			\$1,571.000	\$ 9,426.00	\$ 1,178.25	\$ 7,069.50
02-15	Miramar Library	6	MTH	\$2,028.000	\$ 12,168.00			\$1,023.000	\$ 6,138.00	\$ 767.25	\$ 4,603.50
02-16	Straight-time Hfry Rate - Field Mechanic/Technicians	300	HR	\$148.000	\$ 44,400.00			\$121.500	\$ 36,450.00	\$ 121.50	\$ 36,450.00
02-17	Over-time Hfry Rate - Field Mechanic/Technicians	300	HR	\$222.000	\$ 66,600.00			\$182.250	\$ 54,675.00	\$ 182.25	\$ 54,675.00
02-18	Straight-time Hfry Rate - Supervisor	300	HR	\$165.000	\$ 49,500.00			\$121.500	\$ 36,450.00	\$ 121.50	\$ 36,450.00
02-19	Over-time Hfry Rate - Supervisor	300	HR	\$247.500	\$ 74,250.00			\$182.250	\$ 54,675.00	\$ 182.25	\$ 54,675.00
02-20	Allowance	107,000	EA	\$1.000	\$ 107,000.00			\$1.000	\$ 107,000.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 107,000.00
Group 2 Total					\$ 589,394.00		\$ 657,098.78		\$ 480,299.00		\$ 432,536.75
Group(s) Total Award							\$ 657,098.78				\$ 432,536.75
							Award - Group 1 Interim				Award - Group 2 Interim