

**PRICE ANALYSIS**

Submersible Lift Station  
Bid OPN2115473B2 Pumps Parts and Repair  
Lot: Group 1

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Grundfos		F J Nugent & Associates		Barney's Pumps Inc.		Estimate based on previous contract Y1308004B1 awarded 3/2015	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total		Price
01	Submersible Pump Curve #1 240V 3 Phase OPN2115473B2--01- 3 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	2	each	\$ 2,382.00	\$ 4,764.00	\$ 2,559.00	\$ 5,118.00	\$ 2,854.00	\$ 5,708.00	\$ 2,570.00	\$ 5,140.00
02	Submersible Pump Curve #1 240V Single OPN2115473B2--01- Phase 3 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. G	2	each	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2,159.00	\$ 4,318.00	\$ 2,846.00	\$ 5,692.00	\$ 2,570.00	\$ 5,140.00
03	Submersible Pump Curve #1 480V 3 Phase OPN2115473B2--01- 3 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	10	each	\$ 2,382.00	\$ 23,820.00	\$ 2,559.00	\$ 25,590.00	\$ 2,854.00	\$ 28,540.00	\$ 2,170.00	\$ 21,700.00
					<b>\$ 23,820.00</b>		<b>\$ 35,026.00</b>		<b>\$ 39,940.00</b>		<b>\$ 31,980.00</b>
					REJ (1)		10%				
							Above estimate				

REJ (1): Bidder did not bid on all line items of the group as the specified basis of award and required in the bid comments section of the solicitation.

Submersible Lift Station  
Pumps Parts and Repair  
Bid OPN2115473B2  
Lot: Group 2

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Grundfos		F J Nugent & Associates		Barney's Pumps Inc.	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
OPN2115473B2--02-01	Submersible Pump Curve #2 240V 3 Phase 5 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	2	each	\$ 2,490.00	\$ 4,980.00	\$ 2,659.00	\$ 5,318.00	\$ 2,978.00	\$ 5,956.00
OPN2115473B2--02-02	Submersible Pump Curve #2 240V Single Phase 5 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guid	10	each	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2,420.00	\$ 24,200.00	\$ 3,190.00	\$ 31,900.00
OPN2115473B2--02-03	Submersible Pump Curve #2 480V 3 Phase 5 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	2	each	\$ 2,490.00	\$ 4,980.00	\$ 2,659.00	\$ 5,318.00	\$ 2,978.00	\$ 5,956.00
					<b>\$ 9,960.00</b>		<b>\$ 34,836.00</b>		<b>\$ 43,812.00</b>

REJ (1)  
6%  
Below estimate

REJ (1): Bidder did not bid on all line items of the group as the specified basis of award and required in the bid comments section of the solicitation.

Bid OPN2115473B2 Submersible Lift Station  
 Lot: Group 2 Pumps Parts and Repair

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Price	Total
	Submersible Pump				
	Curve #2 240V 3 Phase 5				
	HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in.				
OPN2115473B2--02-01	Guide	2	each	\$ 2,670.00	\$ 5,340.00
	Submersible Pump				
	Curve #2 240V Single				
	Phase 5 HP 4 in.				
OPN2115473B2--02-02	Discharge 2 in. Guid	10	each	\$ 2,670.00	\$ 26,700.00
	Submersible Pump				
	Curve #2 480V 3 Phase 5				
	HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in.				
OPN2115473B2--02-03	Guide	2	each	\$ 2,431.00	\$ 4,862.00
					<b>\$ 36,902.00</b>

REJ (1): Bidder did not bid on all line items of the group as the specified basis of award and required in the bid comments section of the solicitation.

Submersible Lift Station  
 Bid OPN2115473B2 Pumps Parts and Repair  
 Lot: Group 3

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Grundfos		Barney's Pumps Inc.		F J Nugent & Associates Inc	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
	Submersible Pump Curve #3 240V 3 Phase 5.5 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	6	each	\$2,490.00	\$ 14,940.00	AWD		\$ 3,437.00	\$ 20,622.00
OPN2115473B2--03-01	Submersible Pump Curve #3 240V Single Phase 5.5 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. G	3	each	No Bid	No Bid			\$ 3,386.00	\$ 10,158.00
	Submersible Pump Curve #3 480V 3 Phase 5.5 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	2	each	\$2,490.00	\$ 4,980.00	AWD		\$ 3,437.00	\$ 6,874.00
OPN2115473B2--03-02					\$ 19,920.00				\$ 37,654.00
					36%				
					Below estimate				

Note: Due to no responsive bids for Item 3-02, the award of this group is recommended to be on a line item basis.

AWD: Recommended for Award

REJ (1): Item offered exceeds the maximum rated horsepower as specified in the Item Description.

REJ (2): Item offered does not meet the discharge as specified in the Item Description.

Bid OPN2115473B2 Submersible Lift Station  
 Lot: Group 3 Pumps Parts and Repair

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Price	Total
	Submersible Pump Curve #3 240V 3 Phase				
OPN2115473B2--03-01	5.5 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide Submersible Pump Curve #3 240V Single Phase 5.5 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. G	6	each	\$ 3,397.00	\$ 20,382.00
OPN2115473B2--03-02	Submersible Pump Curve #3 480V 3 Phase 5.5 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	3	each		
OPN2115473B2--03-03	Submersible Pump Curve #3 480V 3 Phase 5.5 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	2	each	\$ 3,397.00	\$ 6,794.00
					<b>\$ 27,176.00</b>

Estimate based on previous contract Y1308004B1 awarded 3/2015

Note: Due to no responsive bids for Item 3-02, the award of this group is recommended to be on a line item basis.

AWD: Recommended for Award

REJ (1): Item offered exceeds the maximum rated horsepower as specified in the Item Description.

REJ (2): Item offered does not meet the discharge as specified in the Item Description.

Bid OPN2115473B2 Submersible Lift Station  
 Lot: Group 4 Pumps Parts and Repair

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Grundfos		Barney's Pumps Inc.		F J Nugent & Associates Inc	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
	Submersible Pump								
	Curve #4 240V 3 Phase								
	7.5 HP 4 in. Discharge 2								
OPN2115473B2--04-01	in. Guide	15	each	\$ 3,236.00	\$ 48,540.00	\$ 3,306.00	\$ 49,590.00	\$ 3,471.00	\$ 52,065.00
	Submersible Pump								
	Curve #4 480V 3 Phase								
	7.5 HP 4 in. Discharge 2								
OPN2115473B2--04-02	in. Guide	3	each	\$ 3,236.00	\$ 9,708.00	\$ 3,306.00	\$ 9,918.00	\$ 3,471.00	\$ 10,413.00
					<b>\$ 58,248.00</b>		<b>\$ 59,508.00</b>		<b>\$ 62,478.00</b>

Note: BAFO applicable between Grundfos and Barney's (local bidder)

Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts and  
Repair - Best and Final Offer

Bid #OPN2115473B2

Lot: Group 4

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Barney's Pumps Inc.		Grundfos		Estimate based on previous contract Y130804B1 awarded 3/2015	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
OPN2115473B2--01-01	Best and Final Offer Submersible Pump Curve #4 240V 3 Phase 7.5 HP 4 in.	15	each	\$ 3,039.00	\$ 45,585.00	\$ 3,069.00	\$ 46,035.00	\$ 3,482.00	\$ 52,230.00
OPN2115473B2--01-02	Best and Final Offer Submersible Pump Curve #4 480V 3 Phase 7.5 HP 4 in.	3	each	\$ 3,039.00	\$ 9,117.00	\$ 3,069.00	\$ 9,207.00	\$ 3,482.00	\$ 10,446.00
				<b>\$ 54,702.00</b>		<b>\$ 55,242.00</b>			<b>\$ 62,676.00</b>

15%

Below estimate

Submersible Lift Station  
Pumps Parts and Repair

Bid OPN2115473B2  
Lot: Group 5

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Barney's Pumps Inc.		Grundfos		F J Nugent & Associates Inc	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
OPN2115473B2--05-01	Submersible Pump Curve #5 240V 3 Phase 10 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	10	each	\$ 3,837.00	\$ 38,370.00	\$ 4,090.00	\$ 40,900.00	\$ 4,504.00	\$ 45,040.00
	Submersible Pump Curve #5 480V 3 Phase 10 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	4	each	\$ 3,837.00	\$ 15,348.00	\$ 4,090.00	\$ 16,360.00	\$ 4,504.00	\$ 18,016.00
					<b>\$ 53,718.00</b>		<b>\$ 57,260.00</b>		<b>\$ 63,056.00</b>

14%  
Below estimate



Submersible Lift Station  
Pumps Parts and Repair

Bid OPN2115473B2  
Lot: Group 5

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Price	Total
	Submersible Pump Curve #5 240V 3 Phase 10 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	10	each	\$ 4,374.00	\$ 43,740.00
OPN2115473B2--05-01	Submersible Pump Curve #5 480V 3 Phase 10 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	4	each	\$ 4,374.00	\$ 17,496.00
					<b>\$ 61,236.00</b>

Estimate based on  
previous contract  
Y1308004B1 awarded  
3/2015

Submersible Lift Station  
Pumps Parts and Repair

Bid OPN2115473B2  
Lot: Group 6

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Barney's Pumps Inc.		F J Nugent & Associates		Grundfos	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
	Submersible Pump								
	Curve #6 240V 3 Phase								
	10 HP 4 in. Discharge 2								
OPN2115473B2--06-01	in. Guide	10	each	\$4,115.00	\$ 41,150.00	\$4,470.00	\$ 44,700.00	\$4,990.00	\$ 49,900.00
	Submersible Pump								
	Curve #6 480V 3 Phase								
	10 HP 4 in. Discharge 2								
OPN2115473B2--06-02	in. Guide	6	each	\$4,115.00	\$ 24,690.00	\$4,470.00	\$ 26,820.00	\$4,090.00	\$ 24,540.00
					<b>\$ 65,840.00</b>		<b>\$ 71,520.00</b>		<b>\$ 74,440.00</b>

2%

Below estimate

Submersible Lift Station  
Pumps Parts and Repair

Bid OPN2115473B2  
Lot: Group 6

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Price	Total
	Submersible Pump Curve #6 240V 3 Phase				
	10 HP 4 in. Discharge 2				
OPN2115473B2--06-01	in. Guide	10	each	\$ 4,195.00	\$ 41,950.00
	Submersible Pump Curve #6 480V 3 Phase				
	10 HP 4 in. Discharge 2				
OPN2115473B2--06-02	in. Guide	6	each	\$ 4,195.00	\$ 25,170.00
					<b>\$ 67,120.00</b>

Estimate based on  
previous contract  
Y1308004B1 awarded  
3/2015

Submersible Lift Station  
Pumps Parts and Repair

Bid OPN2115473B2  
Lot: Group 7

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Grundfos		Barney's Pumps Inc.		F J Nugent & Associates Inc	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
	Submersible Pump								
	Curve #7 240V 3 Phase								
	15 HP 4 in. Discharge 2								
OPN2115473B2--07-01	in. Guide	6	each	\$ 4,990.00	\$ 29,940.00	\$ 5,062.00	\$ 30,372.00	\$ 5,458.00	\$ 32,748.00
	Submersible Pump								
	Curve #7 480V 3 Phase								
	15 HP 4 in. Discharge 2								
OPN2115473B2--07-02	in. Guide	1	each	\$ 4,990.00	\$ 4,990.00	\$ 5,062.00	\$ 5,062.00	\$ 5,458.00	\$ 5,458.00
					<b>\$ 34,930.00</b>		<b>\$ 35,434.00</b>		<b>\$ 38,206.00</b>

Note: BAFO applicable between Grundfos and Barney's (local bidder)

Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts  
and Repair - Best and Final Offer

Bid #OPN2115473B2

Lot: Group 7

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Barney's Pumps Inc.		Grundfos		Estimate based on previous contract Y1308004B1 awarded 3/2015	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
	Best and Final Offer Submersible Pump Curve #7 240V 3 Phase 15 HP 4	6	each	\$4,595.00	\$ 27,570.00	\$4,729.00	\$ 28,374.00	\$ 5,469.00	\$ 32,814.00
OPN2115473B2--02-01	in. Best and Final Offer Submersible Pump Curve #7 480V 3 Phase 15 HP 4	1	each	\$4,595.00	\$ 4,595.00	\$4,729.00	\$ 4,729.00	\$ 5,469.00	\$ 5,469.00
OPN2115473B2--02-02	in.				<b>\$ 32,165.00</b>		<b>\$ 33,103.00</b>		<b>\$ 38,283.00</b>

19%  
Below estimate

Submersible Lift Station  
Pumps Parts and Repair

Bid OPN2115473B2  
Lot: Group 8

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Barney's Pumps Inc.		Grundfos		F J Nugent & Associates Inc	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
OPN2115473B2--08-01	Submersible Pump Curve #8 240V 3 Phase 15 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	6	each	\$ 4,974.00	\$ 29,844.00	\$ 4,990.00	\$ 29,940.00	\$ 5,296.00	\$ 31,776.00
	Submersible Pump Curve #8 480V 3 Phase 15 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	3	each	\$ 4,974.00	\$ 14,922.00	\$ 4,990.00	\$ 14,970.00	\$ 5,296.00	\$ 15,888.00
				<b>\$ 44,766.00</b>		<b>\$ 44,910.00</b>		<b>\$</b>	<b>47,664.00</b>

7%

Below estimate

Submersible Lift Station  
Pumps Parts and Repair

Bid OPN2115473B2  
Lot: Group 8

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Price	Total
	Submersible Pump Curve #8 240V 3 Phase 15 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	6	each	\$ 5,307.00	\$ 31,842.00
OPN2115473B2--08-01	Submersible Pump Curve #8 480V 3 Phase 15 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	3	each	\$ 5,307.00	\$ 15,921.00
					<b>\$ 47,763.00</b>

Estimate based on  
previous contract  
Y1308004B1 awarded  
3/2015

Submersible Lift Station  
Pumps Parts and Repair

Bid OPN2115473B2

Lot: Group 9

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Grundfos		Barney's Pumps Inc.		F J Nugent & Associates Inc	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
	Submersible Pump								
	Curve #9 240V 3 Phase								
	15 HP 4 in. Discharge 2								
OPN2115473B2--09-01	in. Guide	1	each	\$ 4,990.00	\$ 4,990.00	\$ 5,164.00	\$ 5,164.00	\$ 5,309.00	\$ 5,309.00
	Submersible Pump								
	Curve #9 480V 3 Phase								
	15 HP 4 in. Discharge 2								
OPN2115473B2--09-02	in. Guide	1	each	\$ 4,990.00	\$ 4,990.00	\$ 5,164.00	\$ 5,164.00	\$ 5,309.00	\$ 5,309.00
				<b>\$ 9,980.00</b>	<b>\$ 9,980.00</b>	<b>\$ 10,328.00</b>	<b>\$ 10,328.00</b>	<b>\$ 10,618.00</b>	<b>\$ 10,618.00</b>
				REJ(1)		3%			
						Below estimate			

REJ (1): Items offered exceed the maximum rated horsepower as specified in the Item Description.



Submersible Lift Station  
Pumps Parts and Repair

Bid OPN2115473B2

Lot: Group 9

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Price	Total
	Submersible Pump				
	Curve #9 240V 3 Phase				
	15 HP 4 in. Discharge 2				
OPN2115473B2--09-01	in. Guide	1	each	\$ 5,320.00	\$ 5,320.00
	Submersible Pump				
	Curve #9 480V 3 Phase				
	15 HP 4 in. Discharge 2				
OPN2115473B2--09-02	in. Guide	1	each	\$ 5,320.00	\$ 5,320.00
					<b>\$ 10,640.00</b>

Estimate based on  
previous contract  
Y1308004B1 awarded  
3/2015

REJ (1): Items offered exceed the maximum rated horsepower as specified in the Item Description.

Bid OPN2115473B2 Submersible Lift Station  
 Lot: Group 10 Pumps Parts and Repair

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Grundfos		Barney's Pumps Inc.		F J Nugent & Associates Inc	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
	Submersible Pump Curve #10 240V 3 Phase 20 HP 6 in. Discharge 2	10	each	\$ 5,546.00	\$ 55,460.00	\$ 5,677.00	\$ 56,770.00	\$ 6,356.00	\$ 63,560.00
OPN2115473B2--10-01	in. Guide Submersible Pump Curve #10 480V 3 Phase 20 HP 6 in. Discharge 2	10	each	\$ 5,546.00	\$ 55,460.00	\$ 5,677.00	\$ 56,770.00	\$ 6,356.00	\$ 63,560.00
OPN2115473B2--10-02	in. Guide	10	each	\$ 5,546.00	\$ 55,460.00	\$ 5,677.00	\$ 56,770.00	\$ 6,356.00	\$ 63,560.00
					<b>\$ 110,920.00</b>		<b>\$ 113,540.00</b>		<b>\$ 127,120.00</b>

Note: BAFO applicable between Grundfos and Barney's (local bidder)

Submersible Lift Station Pumps Parts and  
Repair - Best and Final Offer

Bid #OPN2115473B2

Lot: Group 10

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Barney's Pumps Inc.		Grundfos		Estimate based on previous contract Y1308004B1 awarded 3/2015	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
OPN2115473B2--03-01	Best and Final Offer Submersible Pump Curve #10 240V 3 Phase 20 HP 6 in.	10	each	\$ 5,038.00	\$ 50,380.00	\$ 5,259.00	\$ 52,590.00	\$ 5,883.00	\$ 58,830.00
OPN2115473B2--03-02	Best and Final Offer Submersible Pump Curve #10 480V 3 Phase 20 HP 6 in.	10	each	\$ 5,038.00	\$ 50,380.00	\$ 5,259.00	\$ 52,590.00	\$ 5,883.00	\$ 58,830.00
					<b>\$ 100,760.00</b>		<b>\$ 105,180.00</b>		<b>\$ 117,660.00</b>

17%  
Below estimate

Bid OPN2115473B2  
 Lot: Group 11  
 Submersible Lift Station  
 Pumps Parts and Repair

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Barney's Pumps Inc.		Grundfos		F J Nugent & Associates Inc	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
OPN2115473B2--11-01	Submersible Pump Curve #11 240V 3 Phase 20 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	10	each	\$ 5,453.00	\$ 54,530.00	\$ 5,546.00	\$ 55,460.00	\$ 5,872.00	\$ 58,720.00
	Submersible Pump Curve #11 480V 3 Phase 20 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	10	each	\$ 5,453.00	\$ 54,530.00	\$ 5,546.00	\$ 55,460.00	\$ 5,872.00	\$ 58,720.00
					<b>\$ 109,060.00</b>		<b>\$ 110,920.00</b>		<b>\$ 117,440.00</b>

8%  
Below estimate

Bid OPN2115473B2 Submersible Lift Station  
 Lot: Group 11 Pumps Parts and Repair

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Price	Total
	Submersible Pump Curve #11 240V 3 Phase 20 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	10	each	\$ 5,883.00	\$ 58,830.00
OPN2115473B2--11-01	Submersible Pump Curve #11 480V 3 Phase 20 HP 4 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	10	each	\$ 5,883.00	\$ 58,830.00
OPN2115473B2--11-02					<b>\$ 117,660.00</b>

Estimate based on  
previous contract  
Y1308004B1 awarded  
3/2015

Bid OPN2115473B2 Submersible Lift Station  
 Lot: Group 12 Pumps Parts and Repair

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Price	Total	Groundfos	F J Nugent & Associates	Barney's Pumps Inc.	Estimate based on previous contract Y1308004B1 awarded 3/2015
OPN2115473B2--12-01	Submersible Pump Curve #12 480V 3 Phase 25 HP 4 in. Discharge 3 in. Guide	3	each	\$6,841.00	\$ 20,523.00		\$7,228.00	\$ 7,890.00	\$7,239.00
					REJ(1)		\$ 21,684.00	\$ 23,670.00	\$21,717.00

0.2%  
Below estimate

REJ (1): Item offered exceeds the maximum rated horsepower as specified in the Item Description.

Note: BAFO applicable between FJ Nugent and Barney's (local bidder)

Submersible Lift Station  
Pumps Parts and Repair

Bid OPN2115473B2  
Lot: Group 13

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Grundfos		Barney's Pumps Inc.		F J Nugent & Associates Inc	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
OPN2115473B2--13-01	Submersible Pump Curve #13 240V 3 Phase 30 HP 4 in. Discharge 3	1	each	\$8,090.00	\$ 8,090.00	\$8,367.00	\$ 8,367.00	\$8,526.00	\$ 8,526.00
	Submersible Pump Curve #13 480V 3 Phase 30 HP 6 in. Discharge 3			\$8,090.00	\$ 48,540.00	\$8,367.00	\$ 50,202.00	\$8,526.00	\$ 51,156.00
OPN2115473B2--13-02	in. Guide	6	each		<b>\$ 56,630.00</b>		<b>\$ 58,569.00</b>		<b>\$ 59,682.00</b>

REJ(1)  
2%  
Below estimate

REJ (1): Items offered exceed the maximum rated horsepower as specified in the Item Description.

\*Not on previous contract, average of all bids used for comparison.

Submersible Lift Station  
Pumps Parts and Repair

Bid OPN2115473B2  
Lot: Group 13

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Price	Total
	Submersible Pump Curve #13 240V 3 Phase 30 HP 4 in. Discharge 3				
OPN2115473B2--13-01	in. Guide	1	each	\$8,327.67	\$8,327.67 *
	Submersible Pump Curve #13 480V 3 Phase 30 HP 6 in. Discharge 3				
OPN2115473B2--13-02	in. Guide	6	each	\$8,539.00	\$51,234.00
					<b>\$59,561.67</b>

REJ (1): Items offered exceed the maximum rated horsepower as specified in the Item Description.

\*Not on previous contract, average of all bids used for comp:



Bid OPN2115473B2 Submersible Lift Station  
 Lot: Group 14 Pumps Parts and Repair

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Barney's Pumps Inc.	Grundfos	F J Nugent & Associates Inc	Estimate based on previous contract Y1308004B1 awarded 3/2015
				Price	Total	Price	Total
OPN2115473B2--14-01	Submersible Pump Curve #14 480V 3 Phase 40 HP 6 in. Discharge 2 in. Guide	2	each	\$ 10,409.00	\$ 20,818.00	\$ 11,061.00	\$ 22,122.00
					\$ 10,466.00	\$ 20,932.00	\$ 11,055.00
							\$ 22,110.00

6%  
Below estimate

Bid OPN2115473B2 Submersible Lift Station  
 Pumps Parts and Repair  
 Lot: Group 15

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Grundfos		Barney's Pumps Inc.		F J Nugent & Associates Inc		Estimate based on previous contract Y1308004B1 awarded 3/2015	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total		Price
OPN2115473B2--15-01	Submersible Pump Curve #15 480V 3 Phase 60 HP 6 in. Discharge 3 in. Guide	3	each	\$ 15,191.00	\$ 45,573.00 REJ(1)	\$ 15,319.00	\$ 45,957.00 REJ(1)	\$ 16,180.00	\$ 48,540.00 0.04%	\$ 16,174.00	\$ 48,522.00

REJ (1): Item offered exceeds the maximum rated horsepower as specified in the Item Description.

Above estimate

Bid OPN2115473B2 Submersible Lift Station  
 Lot: Group 16 Pumps Parts and Repair

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Barney's Pumps Inc. Price	Total	Grundfos Price	Total	F J Nugent & Associates Inc Price	Total	Estimate based on previous contract Y1308004B1 awarded 3/2015 Price	Total
OPN2115473B2--16-01	Submersible Pump Curve # 16 3 Phase 480V 50 HP 6 in. Discharge 3 in. G	6	each	\$ 14,012.00	\$ 84,072.00 REJ (1)	\$ 14,691.00	\$ 88,146.00 REJ (1)	\$ 15,183.00	\$ 91,098.00 3% Below estimate	\$ 15,660.00	\$ 93,960.00

REJ (1): Items offered exceed the maximum rated horsepower as specified in the Item Description.

Submersible Lift Station  
Pumps Parts and Repair

Bid OPN2115473B2  
Lot: Group 17

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Price	Total	Groundfos	F J Nugent & Associates Inc	Barney's Pumps Inc.
OPN2115473B2--17-01	Submersible Pump Curve # 17 480V 3 Phase Rated 100 HP 6 in. Discharge 3 in	3	each	\$ 18,141.00	\$ 54,423.00		\$ 22,906.00	No Bid
					REJ(1)		12%	
							Above estimate	

REJ (1): Item offered exceeds the maximum rated horsepower as specified in the Item Description.

\*Not on previous contract, average of all bids used for comparison.

Submersible Lift Station  
Pumps Parts and Repair

Bid OPN2115473B2  
Lot: Group 17

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Price	Total
					Estimate based on previous contract Y1308004B1 awarded 3/2015
OPN2115473B2--17-01	Submersible Pump Curve # 17 480V 3 Phase Rated 100 HP 6 in. Discharge 3 in	3	each	\$ 20,523.50	\$ 61,570.50 *

REJ (1): Item offered exceeds the maximum rated horsepower as specified in the Item Description.

\*Not on previous contract, average of all bids used for compa

Bid OPN2115473B2  
Lot: Group 18  
Submersible Lift Station  
Pumps Parts and Repair

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Barney's Pumps Inc.		F J Nugent & Associates Inc		Grundfos	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
OPN2115473B2--18-01	Submersible Pump No Curve 75 HP 3 Phase 480V 6 in. Discharge 3 in. Guide	1	each	\$ 16,057.00	\$ 16,057.00	\$ 21,506.00	\$ 21,506.00	\$ 15,366.00	\$ 15,366.00
OPN2115473B2--18-02	Submersible Pump No Curve 15 HP 240V 3 Phase 15 HP 6 in Discharge	3	each	\$ 6,574.00	\$ 19,722.00	\$ 5,292.00	\$ 15,876.00	\$ 7,519.00	\$ 22,557.00
OPN2115473B2--18-03	Submersible Pump No Curve 30 HP 480V 3 Phase 15 HP 4 in. Discharge	2	each	\$ 7,924.00	\$ 15,848.00	\$ 8,174.00	\$ 16,348.00	\$ 8,514.00	\$ 17,028.00
OPN2115473B2--18-04	Submersible Pump No Curve 25 HP 480V 3 Phase 25 HP 12 in. Discharge	3	each	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 9,442.00	\$ 28,326.00	\$ 10,870.00	\$ 32,610.00
OPN2115473B2--18-05	Submersible Pump No Curve 30 HP 480V 3 Phase 30 HP 10 in. Discharge	3	each	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 8,994.00	\$ 26,982.00	\$ 8,801.00	\$ 26,403.00
				<b>\$ 51,627.00</b>	<b>\$ 51,627.00</b>	<b>\$ 109,038.00</b>	<b>\$ 109,038.00</b>	<b>\$ 113,964.00</b>	<b>\$ 113,964.00</b>

REJ(1)  
1%  
Below estimate

REJ (1): Bidder did not bid on all line items of the group as the specified basis of award and required in the bid comments section of the solicitation.  
\*Not on previous contract, average of all bids used for comparison.

Bid OPN2115473B2 Submersible Lift Station  
 Lot: Group 18 Pumps Parts and Repair

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	Price	Estimate based on previous contract Y1308004B1 awarded 3/2015 Total
OPN2115473B2--18-01	Submersible Pump No Curve 75 HP 3 Phase 480V 6 in. Discharge 3 in. Guide	1	each	\$ 17,643.00	\$ 17,643.00 *
OPN2115473B2--18-02	Submersible Pump No Curve 15 HP 240V 3 Phase 15 HP 6 in Discharge	3	each	\$ 6,461.67	\$ 19,385.00 *
OPN2115473B2--18-03	Submersible Pump No Curve 30 HP 480V 3 Phase 15 HP 4 in. Discharge	2	each	\$ 8,204.00	\$ 16,408.00 *
OPN2115473B2--18-04	Submersible Pump No Curve 25 HP 480V 3 Phase 25 HP 12 in. Discharge	3	each	\$ 10,156.00	\$ 30,468.00 *
OPN2115473B2--18-05	Submersible Pump No Curve 30 HP 480V 3 Phase 30 HP 10 in. Discharge	3	each	\$ 8,897.50	\$ 26,692.50 *
					<b>\$ 110,596.50</b>

REJ (1): Bidder did not bid on all line items of the group as the specified basis of award and required in the bid comments section of the solicitation.

\*Not on previous contract, average of all bids used for compa

Submersible Lift Station  
Pumps Parts and Repair

Bid OPN2115473B2  
Lot: Group 19

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	F J Nugent & Associates		Grundfos		Barney's Pumps Inc.	
				Price	Total	Price	Total	Price	Total
	Hourly Labor Rate Install or Remove Monday thru Friday 8 a.m. to 5 p.	30	hour	\$ 100.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 98.00	\$ 2,940.00	\$ 114.00	\$ 3,420.00
OPN2115473B2--19-01	Repair Hourly Labor Rate Monday thru Friday 8 a.m. to 5 p.m.	550	hour	\$ 50.00	\$ 27,500.00	\$ 98.00	\$ 53,900.00	\$ 114.00	\$ 62,700.00
	Hourly Labor Rate Install or Remove Emergency Repair Hourly Labor	10	hour	\$ 150.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 171.00	\$ 1,710.00
OPN2115473B2--19-03	Rate Repair Emergency	30	hour	\$ 75.00	\$ 2,250.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 171.00	\$ 5,130.00
OPN2115473B2--19-04	Percentage Discount from List/Catalog Price for repair parts Pass Thru	1	contract	5%	\$75,000.00 \$5,000.00 <b>\$ 114,250.00</b>	10%	\$ 75,000.00 \$ 5,000.00 <b>\$ 142,840.00</b>	5%	\$ 75,000.00 \$ 5,000.00 <b>\$ 152,960.00</b>



