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End Date Apr 20, 2018 2:00:00 PM EDT
Awarded Date Not Yet Awarded

PNC2116634B1

PNC2116634B1--01-01

Performance and Payment Bonds and Insurance

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs
Pioneer Construction Management Services, Inc | [First Offer - $12,200.00 | 1/lump sum $12,200.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: PNC21166348B1-01-01
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Bond & Insurance
Alen Construction Group, Inc. | |First Offer - $14,000.00 | 1/lump sum $14,000.00 Y Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
PNC2116634B1--01-02 Demolition Services and Asbestos Abatement
Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
Pioneer Construction Management Services, Inc | |First Offer - $426,486.23 | 1/lump sum $426,486.23 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: PNC2116634B1-01-02
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Demolition Services and Asbestos Abatement
Alen Construction Group, Inc. | [First Offer - $570,000.00 | 1/lump sum | $57000000 | Y | v
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:
Supplier Totals
f Pioneer Construction Management Services, Inc $468,686.23 (2/2 items)
Bid Contact  Dyan R Miles Address 5921 Hollywood Blvd
ruel@pioneercms.com Hollywood, FL 33021
Ph 305-525-0649
Supplier Code VC0000117908
Qualifications CBE DBE MBE
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Head Attch:
Bid $30,000.00
Allowance
f Alen Construction Group, Inc. $584,000.00 (2/2 items)
Bid Contact  Ruben Alen Address Alen Construction Group,
ruben@alenconstructiongroup.com Inc.
Ph 954-252-1372 5501 SW 162nd Avenue
Fax 754-223-5635 Southwest Ranches, FL
33331
Qualifications DBE MBE SB
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Head
Attch:
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Bid $30,000.00
Allowance
Award Total
$468,686.23 (Does not apply to percentage or no price items.)
* %
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Hernandez, Victoria
From: Miami Wrecking Co. <miamiwreck@aol.com>
Sent: Tuesday, April 03, 2018 3:36 PM
To: Hernandez, Victoria
Cc: olkeriil01@gmail.com
Subject: Re: PNC2116634B1, Demolition Services and Asbestos Abatement

Thank you for the invite but Miami Wrecking Co has decided not to pursue this project
as the Prime Contractor.

Miami Wrecking Co
4540 NW 8th Terrace
Oakland Park, FI 33309
954-492-2727 Office
954-492-2726 Fax
miamiwreck@aol.com

From: Hernandez, Victoria <VHERNANDEZ @broward.org>

To: Hernandez, Victoria <VHERNANDEZ @broward.org>

Sent: Tue, Apr 3, 2018 3:26 pm

Subject: FW: PNC2116634B1, Demolition Services and Asbestos Abatement

Good Afternoon,
This is just a reminder that tomorrow there will be a 2" (optional) site visit at 9am.

Thanks,

BRIGWARD

FLORIDA

Victoria Hernandez

Purchasing Agent

Broward County Purchasing Division

115 S. Andrews Ave. Suite 212, Fort Lauderdale, FL 33301
Phone: 954-357-6078 Fax: 954-357-6823
www.broward.org/purchasing

Customer Care is my priority. How am | doing? Please contact my Manager, Martha Perez-Garviso, at
MPEREZGARVISO@broward.org with feedback.

Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.





