Bid #TRN2115605B1 - Bus Parts: New, Rebuilt, OEM, Aftermarket

Creation Date Nov 24, 2017 End Date Jan 22, 2018 2:00:00 PM EST

Start Date Dec 14, 2017 1:24:42 PM EST Awarded Date Not Yet Awarded

	uses - OEM				
Supplier	Unit Price	-	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
JANEK CORP	First Offer - 100.00%	1 / each	100.00%	Y	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes:	ode:		
EVERGLADES DIESEL INJECTION SERVICE, INC.	First Offer - 35.00%	1 / each	35.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Exhi Administration Funding	bits 5,6,7,8,9,10 and 11		
Neopart	First Offer - 25.00%	1 / each	25.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: See Also attached is FTA bid Also attached in adden	attached price list - Gillion documents		
Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply	First Offer - 15.00%	1 / each	15.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: 15% Time of Order. Current Prices Available http://www.mohawkmf	Discount from Current e on our Website:	List Price in	n Effect i
MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY	First Offer - 12.00%	1 / each	12.00%	Y	Υ

	County Co	I			
2 4 2 4 5 4 2	F: + Off 40 000/		40.000/		
Southern Coach Parts Company	First Offer - 10.00%	1 / each	10.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes:			
THE AFTERMARKET PARTS COMPANY, LLC	First Offer - 10.00%	1 / each	10.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes: Quoting Li US List Price is Column D, Lis subject to change without no	t Less 10% is in colum	nn E. ***Pı	rices a
GILLIG Product Code:	First Offer - 0.00%	1 / each Supplier Product Code:	0.00%		Υ
Agency Notes: Midwest Bus Corporation	First Offer - 0.00%	Supplier Notes: 1 / each	0.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes: FTA Buy America Cert. attach	ed		
Kirk's Automotive Inc.	First Offer - 0.00%	1 / each	0.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes:			
Kirk's Automotive Inc.	Alt 1 - 0.00%	1 / each	0.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes: Additiona	I Ametek Rotron prici	ng	

TRN2115605B101-02 Parts for Gillig b					I _
Supplier	Unit Price		Total Price	Attch.	Docs
JANEK CORP Product Code: Agency Notes:	First Offer - 100.00%	1 / each Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Mail 2018 catalog		Y ket Offe	Yred:jane
M&H Automotive	First Offer - 40.00%	1 / each	40.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Mai	ode: nufacturer/Aftermar	ket Offe	red: NAP.
EVERGLADES DIESEL INJECTION SERVICE, INC.	First Offer - 35.00%	1 / each	35.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Mai		ket Offe	red : Boso
Neopart	First Offer - 25.00%	1 / each	25.00%		Υ
Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc [Ad]	First Offer - 25.00%	1 / each	25.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Mai		ket Offe	red:VMP
Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply	First Offer - 15.00%	1 / each	15.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		MOHAWK	nufacturer/Aftermar rent List Price in Effect a e on our Website:		
MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY	First Offer - 12.00%	1 / each	12.00%		Y
Product Code:	First Offer - 12.00%				T
Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Mai	oue. nufacturer/Aftermar	ket Offe	red : Gill

	County Co	mmissioners			
		Aftermarket ABC-companies Online 12% Off Retail	Store		
	11				
Manuel Gomez & Associates, Inc	First Offer - 12.00%	1 / each	12.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Man Mohawk MFG	ode: nufacturer/Aftermar	ket Offe	ered:
Southern Coach Parts Company	First Offer - 10.00%	1 / each	10.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Man Aftermarket	ode: nufacturer/Aftermar	ket Offe	ered : Gillig
THE AFTERMARKET PARTS COMPANY, LLC	First Offer - 10.00%	1 / each	10.00%	Υ	Υ
		subject to change with		llumn E. *	
Electric Sales&Service,Inc	First Offer - 10.00%	1 / each	10.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Man Delco,CEN EMP	ode: nufacturer/Aftermar	ket Offe	ered:
Midwest Bus Corporation	First Offer - 5.00%	1 / each	5.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Man Midwest Bus	ode: nufacturer/Aftermar	ket Offe	ered:
GILLIG	First Offer - 0.00%	1 / each	0.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Mar GILLIG	ode: nufacturer/Aftermar	ket Offe	ered:
Kirk's Automotive Inc.	First Offer - 0.00%	1 / each	0.00%	Υ	Υ
· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·		1 -			-

Product Code:	Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes:	Supplier Notes: Manufacturer/Aftermarket Offered: Kirk's
	Automotive, Inc.
	Kirk's new and rebuilt aftermarket parts prices
	F

Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
JANEK CORP	First Offer - 100.00%	1 / each	100.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes:	ode:		
EVERGLADES DIESEL INJECTION SERVICE, INC.	First Offer - 35.00%	1 / each	35.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes:	ode:		
Neopart	First Offer - 25.00%	1 / each	25.00%	Υ	Υ
Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply Product Code:	First Offer - 15.00%	1 / each Supplier Product Co	15.00%		Y

MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY	First Offer - 12.00%	1 / each	12.00%		Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co		e	
Southern Coach Parts Company	First Offer - 10.00%	1 / each	10.00%		Y
Product Code:	111	Supplier Product Co			
Agency Notes:		Supplier Notes:			
THE AFTERMARKET PARTS COMPANY, LLC	First Offer - 10.00%	1 / each	10.00%	Υ	Υ
		US List Price is Column subject to change with	D, List Less 10% is in co out notice.	lumn E. **	**Prices ar
			0.000		
	First Offer - 0.00%	1 / each Supplier Product Co	0.00%		Y
Product Code:	First Offer - 0.00%				Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes: Kirk's Automotive Inc. Product Code:	First Offer - 0.00%	Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: 1 / each Supplier Product Co	ode:	Y	Y
GILLIG Product Code: Agency Notes: Kirk's Automotive Inc. Product Code: Agency Notes: Kirk's Automotive Inc.		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: 1 / each Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes:	ode:	Y	

County Col	mmissioners

0	yer buses - Rebuilt/		Taket Date	A 44 - I-	D
Supplier	Unit Price		Total Price	Attch.	Docs
JANEK CORP	First Offer - 100.00%	1 / each	100.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code Supplier Notes: Manuf 2018 catalog		ket Offer	ed : janel
M&H Automotive	First Offer - 40.00%	1 / each	40.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code Supplier Notes: Manuf		ket Offer	ed: NAP
EVERGLADES DIESEL INJECTION SERVICE, INC.	First Offer - 35.00%	1 / each	35.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code Supplier Notes: Manuf BOSCH		ket Offer	ed∶
Neopart	First Offer - 25.00%	1 / each	25.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code Supplier Notes: Manuf FEBI, Firestone, many othe	acturer/Aftermar	ket Offer	ed: MAN
Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc [Ad]	First Offer - 25.00%	1 / each	25.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code Supplier Notes: Manuf		ket Offer	ed:VMP
Manuel Gomez & Associates, Inc	First Offer - 16.00%	1 / each	16.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code Supplier Notes: Manuf Mohawk MFG		ket Offer	ed∶
Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply	First Offer - 15.00%	1 / each	15.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code Supplier Notes: Manuf MOHAWK 15% Discount from Curren Current Prices Available or http://www.mohawkmfg.co	acturer/Aftermar t List Price in Effect a n our Website:		

MUNICIE TRANSIT CURRI V		ommissioners	12.00%		l v
MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY Product Code:	First Offer - 12.00%	1 / each Supplier Product Co	12.00%		Y
Agency Notes:		Supplier Notes: Mar Flyer Aftermarket ABC-companies Online 12% Off Retail	nufacturer/Aftermar	ket Offe	red: New
Southern Coach Parts Company	First Offer - 10.00%	1 / each	10.00%		Т
Product Code:	10.3070	Supplier Product Co			
Agency Notes:		Supplier Notes: Mai Flyer Aftermarket		ket Offe	red : New
THE AFTERMARKET PARTS COMPANY, LLC	First Offer - 10.00%	1 / each	10.00%	Υ	Υ
		US List Price is Column subject to change with	out notice.	olumn E. **	
Electric Sales&Service,Inc	First Offer - 10.00%	1 / each	10.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Man Delco,CEN,EMP		ket Offe	red:
Midwest Bus Corporation	First Offer - 5.00%	1 / each	5.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Mai Midwest Bus		ket Offe	red:
GILLIG	First Offer - 0.00%	1 / each	0.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Mai GILLIG		ket Offe	red:
Kirk's Automotive Inc.	First Offer - 0.00%	1 / each	0.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code:	·	Supplier Product Co	ode:		
Agency Notes:		Supplier Notes: Mai		ket Offe	red : Kirk

Automotive, Inc. Kirk's new and rebuilt aftermarket parts prices

Supplier	uses - OEM Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
JANEK CORP	First Offer - 100.00%	1 / each	100.00%	Y	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes:		-	
EVERGLADES DIESEL INJECTION SERVICE, INC.	First Offer - 35.00%	1 / each	35.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes:	ode:		
Neopart	First Offer - 25.00%	1 / each	25.00%	Υ	Υ
Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply Product Code:	First Offer - 15.00%	1 / each Supplier Product Co	15.00%		Υ

	1		H			
MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY	First Offer -	12.00%	1 / each	12.00%		Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:			Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: ABC 12% Off Retail ABC-companies Online 12% Off Retail	-companies Online Store	e	
Southern Coach Parts Company	First Offer -	10.00%	1 / each	10.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:	Flist Offer -	10.00 /6	Supplier Product Co			<u> </u>
THE AFTERMARKET PARTS COMPANY, LLC	First Offer -	10.00%	1 / each	10.00%	Υ	Υ
Agency Notes:			Supplier Notes: Quoting List Less 10% US List Price is Column subject to change with	D, List Less 10% is in co out notice.	lumn E. **	*Prices are
GILLIG	First Offer	- 0.00%	1 / each	0.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:			Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes:			
Kirk's Automotive Inc.	First Offer	- 0.00%	1 / each	0.00%	Υ	
D						Υ
			Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes:	ode:		Y
Product Code: Agency Notes: Kirk's Automotive Inc.	Alt 1	- 0.00%		ode:	Y	Y

TRN2115605B101-06 Parts for NABI b	uses - Rebuilt/After	market			
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Doc
JANEK CORP	First Offer - 100.00%	1 / each	100.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Cod Supplier Notes: Manu 2108 catalog		ket Offer	ed : jane
M&H Automotive	First Offer - 40.00%	1 / each	40.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Cod Supplier Notes: Manu		ket Offer	ed: NAF
EVERGLADES DIESEL INJECTION SERVICE, INC.	First Offer - 35.00%	1 / each	35.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Cod Supplier Notes: Manu BOSCH		ket Offer	ed:
Neopart	First Offer - 25.00%	1 / each	25.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Cod Supplier Notes: Manu Meritor, Marathon, Dorm	ıfacturer/Aftermar		ed:
Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc [Ad]	First Offer - 25.00%	1 / each	25.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Cod Supplier Notes: Manu		ket Offer	ed:VMF
Manuel Gomez & Associates, Inc	Alt 1 - 17.00%	1 / each	17.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Cod Supplier Notes: Manu Transit		ket Offer	ed :⊺&
Manuel Gomez & Associates, Inc	First Offer - 16.00%	1 / each	16.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Cod Supplier Notes: Manu Mohawk MFG		ket Offer	ed:
Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply	First Offer - 15.00%	1 / each	15.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Cod Supplier Notes: Manu MOHAWK 15% Discount from Curre Current Prices Available of http://www.mohawkmfg.	Ifacturer/Aftermarl nt List Price in Effect a on our Website:		
MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY	First Offer - 12.00%	1 / each	12.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Cod Supplier Notes: Manu Aftermarket ABC-companies Online S	ıfacturer/Aftermar	ket Offer	ed : NAI

٠.	٠.	
TRI	V211	5605B1

Southern Coach Parts Company	First Offer - 10.00%	1 / each	10.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Man Aftermarket	ode: nufacturer/Aftermark	et Offe	ed: NABI
THE AFTERMARKET PARTS COMPANY, LLC	First Offer - 10.00%	1 / each	10.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Quoting List Less 10%	nufacturer/Aftermark D, List Less 10% is in col		
Electric Sales&Service,Inc	First Offer - 10.00%	1 / each	10.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Man Delco,CEN EMP	ode: nufacturer/Aftermark	et Offe	red:
Midwest Bus Corporation	First Offer - 5.00%	1 / each	5.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Man Midwest Bus	ode: NABI nufacturer/Aftermark	cet Offer	ed:
GILLIG	First Offer - 0.00%	1 / each	0.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Man GILLIG	ode: nufacturer/Aftermark	et Offe	red:
Kirk's Automotive Inc.	First Offer - 0.00%	1 / each	0.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Man Automotive, Inc.	ode: nufacturer/Aftermark	cet Offer	'ed : Kirk's

TRN2115605B101-07 Parts for Motor C	coach Industries (MC	CI) buses - OEM				
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs	
JANEK CORP	First Offer - 100.00%	1 / each	100.00%	Υ	Υ	
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes:				
EVERGLADES DIESEL INJECTION SERVICE, INC.	First Offer - 35.00%	1 / each	35.00%		Υ	
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes:	ode:			
Neopart	First Offer - 25.00%	1 / each	25.00%		Υ	
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes:	ode:			
MCI Service Parts, Inc. [Ad]	First Offer - 20.00%	1 / each	20.00%		Υ	
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes:	ode:			

Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply

First Offer - 15.00% 1 / each 15.00%

Product Code: Agency Notes:			Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: 15% Discount from Cur Current Prices Available http://www.mohawkmi	rent List Price in Effect a e on our Website:	at Time of	Order.
MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY	First Offer -	12.00%	1 / each	12.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:			Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: ABC 12% Off Retail	ode: companies Online Stor	e	
Southern Coach Parts Company	First Offer -	10.00%	1 / each	10.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:			Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes:	ode:		
THE AFTERMARKET PARTS COMPANY, LLC	First Offer -	10.00%	1 / each	10.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:			Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Quoting List Less 10% US List Price is Column subject to change with	D, List Less 10% is in co	olumn E. **	*Prices are
GILLIG	First Offer -	0.00%	1 / each	0.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:			Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes:	ode:		
Kirk's Automotive Inc.	First Offer -	0.00%	1 / each	0.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:			Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes:	ode:		
Kirk's Automotive Inc.	Alt 1 -	0.00%	1 / each	0.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:			Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes:	ode:		

TRN2115605B101-08 Parts for Motor C	Coach Industries (MC	CI) buses - Rebuilt/	\ftermarket		
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
JANEK CORP	First Offer - 100.00%	1 / each	100.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Mai 2018 catalog		ket Offer	ed : janek
M&H Automotive	First Offer - 40.00%	1 / each	40.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Ma		ket Offer	ed: NAPA
Neopart	First Offer - 25.00%	1 / each	25.00%		Υ
Product Code:		Supplier Product Co	ode:		

Agency Notes:				nufacturer/Aftermark man, Autex, many other		ed:
Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc [Ad]	First Offer -	25.00%	1 / each	25.00%		Υ
Product Code:	• •		Supplier Product Co	ode:		
Agency Notes:			Supplier Notes: Ma	nufacturer/Aftermark	et Offer	ed:VMP
MCI Service Parts, Inc. [Ad]	First Offer -	20.00%	1 / each	20.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:			Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Man Various	ode: nufacturer/Aftermark	et Offer	ed:
EVERGLADES DIESEL INJECTION SERVICE, INC.	First Offer -	20.00%	1 / each	20.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:			Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Mar CUMMINS	ode: nufacturer/Aftermark	et Offer	ed:
Manuel Gomez & Associates, Inc	First Offer -	16.00%	1 / each	16.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:			Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Man Mohawk MFG	ode: nufacturer/Aftermark	et Offer	ed:
Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply	First Offer -	15.00%	1 / each	15.00%		Υ
			MOHAWK 15% Discount from Cur Current Prices Available http://www.mohawkmi		t Time of C	Order.
MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY	First Offer -	12.00%	1 / each	12.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:			Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Man Aftermarket ABC-companies Online 12% Off Retail	nufacturer/Aftermark	et Offer	ed:MCI
Southern Coach Parts Company	First Offer -	10.00%	1 / each	10.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:			Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Man Aftermarket	ode: nufacturer/Aftermark	et Offer	ed:MCI
THE AFTERMARKET PARTS COMPANY, LLC	First Offer -	10.00%	1 / each	10.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:			Quoting List Less 10%	nufacturer/Aftermark D, List Less 10% is in col		

Electric Sales&Service,Inc	First Offer - 10.00%	1 / each	10.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Mai Delco,CEN EMP	ode: nufacturer/Aftermark	et Offer	ed:
Midwest Bus Corporation	First Offer - 5.00%	1 / each	5.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Man Midwest Bus	ode: nufacturer/Aftermark	et Offer	ed:
Palm Peterbilt Truck Centers, Inc. [Ad]	First Offer - 2.00%	1 / each	2.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Mai	ode: nufacturer/Aftermark	et Offer	ed : no
GILLIG	First Offer - 0.00%	1 / each	0.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Mai GILLIG	ode: nufacturer/Aftermark	et Offer	ed:
Kirk's Automotive Inc.	First Offer - 0.00%	1 / each	0.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Man Automotive, Inc.	ode: nufacturer/Aftermark	et Offer	ed : Kirk'

Supplier	Unit Drice	Oty/Unit	Total Drice	Attab	Doo
• •	Unit Price	Qty/Unit		Attch.	+
JANEK CORP	First Offer - 100.00%	1 / each	100.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier P Supplier N	roduct Code: lotes:		
Stewart & Stevenson FDDA LLC d/b/a Florida Detroit Diesel Allison [Ad]	First Offer - 27.00%	1 / each	27.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		32, 557-33, 5 Supplier N Diesel facto Florida. Full	Product Code: 557-52, 557-54 lotes: We are the strain of t	ne Detroi stributor cians and	it r for d
Manuel Gomez & Associates, Inc	Alt 1 - 20.00%	1 / each	20.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier P Supplier N	roduct Code: lotes:	Robert I	Bosch
EVERGLADES DIESEL INJECTION SERVICE, INC.	First Offer - 20.00%	1 / each	20.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier P Supplier N	Product Code:		-

	County Commissioners				
Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply	First Offer - 15.00%	1 / each	15.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier N 15% Discou Effect at Tin Current Price	Product Code: Notes: unt from Current L ne of Order. ces Available on o .mohawkmfg.cor	ur Webs	
	Fi . Off	4 / 1	11000/	i	
Manuel Gomez & Associates, Inc	First Offer - 14.00%	1 / each	14.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier I	Product Code: Notes:		
MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY	First Offer - 12.00%	1 / each	12.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:			Product Code: Notes: ABC-comp tail	oanies O	nline
Neopart	First Offer - 10.00%	1 / each	10.00%		Υ
Product Code:			Product Code:		
Agency Notes:		Supplier N	Notes:		
THE AFTERMARKET PARTS COMPANY, LLC	First Offer - 10.00%	1 / each	10.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier N US List Price in column E	Product Code: Notes: Quoting L e is Column D, Lis E. ***Prices are su nout notice.	t Less 10	
Lou Bachrodt Freightliner	First Offer - 10.00%	1 / each	10.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier F Supplier N	Product Code: Notes:		
Palm Peterbilt Truck Centers, Inc. [Ad]	First Offer - 10.00%	1 / each	10.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier F Supplier N	Product Code: Notes:		
Agency Notes.					
Southern Coach Parts Company	First Offer - 0.00%	1 / each	0.00%		Υ
-	First Offer - 0.00%	1	Product Code:		Y
Southern Coach Parts Company Product Code:	First Offer - 0.00%	Supplier F Supplier N No Bid 1 / each	Product Code:		Y

TRN2115605B101-10 Parts for Cummir	ns Diesel - OEM				
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
EXPERT DIESEL [Ad]	First Offer - 27.00%	1 / each	27.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code:		Supplier Product Co	de: CUMMINS PARTS		

Agency Notes:			Supplier Notes: COP MARKED UP. THEY ARE				ΞY
CUMMINS SALES AND SERVICE	First Offer -	- 26.00%	1 / each	26.0	00% Y	Y	Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:			Supplier Product Con Supplier Notes: Cat Online/ Web Parts Column Pricing Offered Discount of 26% off list purchased by BCT at set higher discount than 26 will always maintain Se Be aware that parts purpart number will include credited in full if the conacceptable condition. I document for Bid.	ode: Cummins OE alog/List Price ID# a l; Yes- Service Cent t shown is an avera ervice center pricing 5%, and other may cervice Center pricing chased with an NX, e a core charge. The list returned within	M Parts and Date; Quick er age discount of be Some parts mearry be lower, g under this cor be PX,OR RX suff e core charge on a 30 days and	parts nay carry But BC' ntract. A fix in the will be in	y a CT Also
Manuel Gomez & Associates, Inc	First Offer -	- 20.00%	1 / each	20.0	00%	Y	Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:			Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes:	ode: Robert Bosch	Alt		
EVERGLADES DIESEL INJECTION SERVICE, INC.	First Offer -	- 20.00%	1 / each	20.0	00%	TY	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:			Supplier Product Co	ode:			
agonoy notes.			Supplier Notes:				
	Alt 1 -	- 17.00%	1 / each	17.0	00%	Y	Υ
Manuel Gomez & Associates, Inc Product Code:	Alt 1	- 17.00%		'	00%	<u> </u>	Y
Manuel Gomez & Associates, Inc Product Code: Agency Notes: Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply	Alt 1 -		1 / each Supplier Product Co	ode: AcDelco	00%	<u>'</u>	Y Y
Manuel Gomez & Associates, Inc Product Code: Agency Notes: Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply Product Code:			1 / each Supplier Product Co	node: AcDelco 15.0 ode: 6 Discount from Cui e on our Website:	00%	Y	Υ
Manuel Gomez & Associates, Inc Product Code: Agency Notes: Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply Product Code: Agency Notes:		- 15.00%	1 / each Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: 1 / each Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: 15% Time of Order. Current Prices Available	ode: AcDelco 15.0 ode: 6 Discount from Cur e on our Website: fg.com	00%	in Effec	Υ
Manuel Gomez & Associates, Inc Product Code: Agency Notes:	First Offer	- 15.00%	1 / each Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: 1 / each Supplier Product Co Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: 15% Time of Order. Current Prices Available http://www.mohawkm	ode: AcDelco 15.0 ode: 6 Discount from Cur e on our Website: fg.com 12.0 ode:	orrent List Price	in Effec	Y et a

TRN2115605B1

Broward County Board of County Commissioners

Supplier Product Code: Product Code: Supplier Notes: Agency Notes: THE AFTERMARKET PARTS COMPANY, LLC First Offer - 10.00% 1 / each 10.00% Product Code: Supplier Product Code: Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Quoting List Less 10% US List Price is Column D, List Less 10% is in column E. ***Prices are subject to change without notice. First Offer - 10.00% 10.00% Lou Bachrodt Freightliner 1 / each Υ Product Code: Supplier Product Code: Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Palm Peterbilt Truck Centers, Inc. [Ad] First Offer - 10.00% 10.00% 1 / each Product Code: Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes: Agency Notes: Southern Coach Parts Company First Offer - 0.00% 1 / each 0.00% Υ Product Code: Supplier Product Code: Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: No Bid GILLIG First Offer - 0.00% 1 / each 0.00% Υ

TRN2115605B101-11 Parts for Caterpil	lar C9 - OEM							
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Docs				
EVERGLADES DIESEL INJECTION SERVICE, INC.	First Offer - 20.00%	1 / each	20.00%		Υ			
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes:						
Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply	First Offer - 15.00%	1 / each	15.00%		Υ			
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes: 15% Discount from Current List Price in Effect Time of Order. Current Prices Available on our Website: http://www.mohawkmfg.com						
MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY	First Offer - 12.00%	1 / each	12.00%		Υ			
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes: ABC-companies Online Store 12% Off Retail						

Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes:

Product Code:

Agency Notes:

THE AFTERMARKET PARTS COMPANY, LLC	First Offer - 10.00%	1 / each	10.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Quoting List Less 10% US List Price is Column subject to change witho	D, List Less 10% is in colur	mn E. ***F	Prices are
Southern Coach Parts Company	First Offer - 0.00%	1 / each	0.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: No Bid			
Neopart	First Offer - 0.00%	1 / each	0.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes:	de:		
GILLIG	First Offer - 0.00%	1 / each	0.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes:	de:		

Cupplior	Unit Price	Oty/Unit	Total Price Attch.					
Supplier		Qty/Unit		Atten.	Docs			
EVERGLADES DIESEL INJECTION SERVICE, INC.	First Offer - 20.00%	1 / each	20.00%		Υ			
Product Code:		Supplier Product Co	ode:					
Agency Notes:		Supplier Notes:						
Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply	First Offer - 15.00%	1 / each	15.00%		Υ			
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: 15% Di Time of Order. Current Prices Available or http://www.mohawkmfg.co				list Price in	Ellect at			
		http://www.mohawkmf						
MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY	First Offer - 12.00%	http://www.mohawkmf			Y			

Neopart	First Offer - 10.00%	1 / each	10.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes:	de:		
THE AFTERMARKET PARTS COMPANY, LLC	First Offer - 10.00%	1 / each	10.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Quoting List Less 10% US List Price is Column subject to change witho	D, List Less 10% is in col	umn E. ***F	Prices are
Palm Peterbilt Truck Centers, Inc. [Ad]	First Offer - 2.00%	1 / each	2.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes:	de:		
Southern Coach Parts Company	First Offer - 0.00%	1 / each	0.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: No Bid	de:		
GILLIG	First Offer - 0.00%	1 / each	0.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes:	de:		

TRN2115605B101-13 Parts for Allison Standard Transmissi	on - OEM				
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
JANEK CORP	First Offer - 100.00%	1 / each	100.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier P Supplier N	roduct Code: lotes:		
Stewart & Stevenson FDDA LLC d/b/a Florida Detroit Diesel Allison [Ad]	First Offer - 27.00%	1 / each	27.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier N distributor fo Hybrid equi millions in in	ŕ	nly authonissions ned tech	orized and ns and
Reliable Transmission Service, Inc.	First Offer - 25.00%	1 / each	25.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier N	Product Code: lotes: see attac Pricing Catalog		

	County Commissioners				
Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply	First Offer - 15.00%	1 / each	15.00%	,	
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes: 15% Discount from Current List Price in Effect at Time of Order. Current Prices Available on our Websit http://www.mohawkmfg.com			
Manuel Gomez & Associates, Inc	First Offer - 14.00%	1 / each	14.00%	,	
Product Code:	.,		Product Code:		
Agency Notes:		Supplier I			
MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY Product Code:	First Offer - 12.00%	1 / each	Product Code:	,	
Agency Notes:			Notes: ABC-comp	oanies Onli	
Neopart	First Offer - 10.00%	1 / each	10.00%	,	
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier I	Product Code: Notes:		
THE AFTERMARKET PARTS COMPANY, LLC	First Offer - 10.00%	1 / each	10.00%	Υ	
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier I Quoting List US List Pric	t Less 10% e is Column D, List E. ***Prices are su		
Dartco Transmission	First Offer - 10.00%	1 / each	10.00%	Υ	
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes: Allison Transmission OEM parts: Cost plus 10%			
Southern Coach Parts Company	First Offer - 0.00%	1 / each	0.00%	- ,	
Product Code: Agency Notes:			Product Code: Notes: No Bid		

GILLIG	First Offer - 0.00%	1 / each	0.00%	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier P Supplier N	roduct Code: lotes:	

TRN2115605B101-14 Parts for Allison Hybrid Transmission	s - OEM				
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Stewart & Stevenson FDDA LLC d/b/a Florida Detroit Diesel Allison [Ad]	First Offer - 20.00%	1 / each	20.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier N distributor fo	Product Code: 8 lotes: Florida on or Allison transmi oment. Fully train nventory.	ly autho	rized ind
Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply	First Offer - 15.00%	1 / each	15.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier N Current List Current Pric	Product Code: lotes: 15% Disco Price in Effect at es Available on ou mohawkmfg.com	Time of C ur Websi	Order.
MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY	First Offer - 12.00%	1 / each	12.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:			Product Code: lotes: ABC-comp	anies O	nline
Neopart	First Offer - 10.00%	1 / each	10.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier F Supplier N	roduct Code:		
THE AFTERMARKET PARTS COMPANY, LLC	First Offer - 10.00%	1 / each	10.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier N US List Price	Product Code: lotes: Quoting List is Column D, List *Prices are subjece.	Less 10 ^o	% is in
Midwest Bus Corporation	First Offer - 5.00%	1 / each	5.00%		Υ

Product Code:		Supplier P	roduct Code: A	Allison	
Agency Notes:		Supplier N	lotes:		
Dartco Transmission	First Offer - 5.00%	1 / each	5.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:				nsmissio	on
Southern Coach Parts Company	First Offer - 0.00%	1 / each	0.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier F Supplier N No Bid	Product Code: lotes:		
GILLIG	First Offer - 0.00%	1 / each	0.00%		Υ
Product Code:			roduct Code:		
Agency Notes:		Supplier N	lotes:		

Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
JANEK CORP	First Offer - 100.00%	1 / each	100.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes:	de:		
Neopart	First Offer - 15.00%	1 / each	15.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes:	de:		
Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply	First Offer - 15.00%	1 / each	15.00%		Υ
Agency Notes:		Supplier Notes: 15% Time of Order. Current Prices Available http://www.mohawkmfo	on our Website:	List Price ir	n Effect a
MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY	First Offer - 12.00%	1 / each	12.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: ABC- 12% Off Retail		e	
Southern Coach Parts Company	First Offer - 10.00%	1 / each	10.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Then			
THE AFTERMARKET PARTS COMPANY, LLC	First Offer - 10.00%	1 / each	10.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Quoting List Less 10% US List Price is Column I		lumn = ***	·Driego g

	,	,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,			
		subject to change without notice.			
Midwest Bus Corporation Product Code: Agency Notes:	1 / each Supplier Product Co	5.00% ode: Thermo King		Y	
GILLIG	First Offer - 0.00%	1 / each	0.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes:	ode:		
Thermo King Miami	First Offer - 0.00%	1 / each	0.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Elite Price / TK53040-1-1			

TRN2115605B101-16 Parts for Air Conditioning Sutrak - O	⊏ IVI					
Supplier	Unit	Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Doc
Neopart	First Offer - 2	25.00%	1 / each	25.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:			Supplier P Supplier N	roduct Code: otes:		
Stewart & Stevenson FDDA LLC d/b/a Florida Detroit Diesel Allison [Ad]	First Offer - 2	20.00%	1 / each	20.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:			Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes: Sutrak original equipment through MCC			
Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply	First Offer -	15.00%	1 / each	15.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:			Supplier N Current List Current Price	roduct Code: lotes: 15% Disco Price in Effect at les Available on or mohawkmfg.con	Time of (ur Websi	Order.
MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY	First Offer -	12.00%	1 / each	12.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:				roduct Code: lotes: ABC-comp ail	oanies O	nline
Southern Coach Parts Company	First Offer -	10.00%	1 / each	10.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:			Supplier P Supplier N	roduct Code: otes:		
THE AFTERMARKET PARTS COMPANY, LLC	First Offer -	10.00%	1 / each	10.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:			Supplier N Quoting List		Less 10	% is in

		column E. ** without noti	**Prices are subje ce.	ct to cha	nge
Midwest Bus Corporation	First Offer - 5.00%	1 / each	5.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: Sutrak Supplier Notes:			
Sutrak USA	First Offer - 2.00%	1 / each	2.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier F Supplier N	Product Code: lotes:		
GILLIG	First Offer - 0.00%	1 / each	0.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier F Supplier N	Product Code: lotes:		

	M		1			
Supplier	Un	it Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Doc
Stewart & Stevenson FDDA LLC d/b/a Florida Detroit Diesel Allison [Ad]	First Offer -	20.00%	1 / each	20.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:			Supplier N	Product Code: lotes: Bitzer orig hrough MCC	nal	
Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply	First Offer -	15.00%	1 / each	15.00%		Υ
Product Code:	1		Supplier P	roduct Code:		
			Effect at Tim Current Price	nt from Current Li ne of Order. es Available on ou mohawkmfg.com	ır Websi	
Palm Peterbilt Truck Centers, Inc. [Ad]	First Offer -	15.00%	1 / each	15.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:			Supplier P Supplier N	roduct Code: lotes:		
MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY	First Offer -	12.00%	1 / each	12.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:				Product Code: lotes: ABC-comp	anies Oi	nline
Southern Coach Parts Company	First Offer -	10.00%	1 / each	10.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:			Supplier P Supplier N	roduct Code: lotes:		
THE AFTERMARKET PARTS COMPANY, LLC	First Offer -	10.00%	1 / each	10.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:			Supplier N Quoting List			

TRN2115605B1

Neopart	First Offer - 0.00%	1 / each	0.00%	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier F Supplier N	Product Code:	
GILLIG	First Offer - 0.00%	1 / each	0.00%	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier F Supplier N	Product Code:	

TRN2115605B101-18 Parts for Brakes		0	Total Balan	A sa - l-	D
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Neopart	First Offer - 40.00%	1 / each	40.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: We c sourcesMeritor, MGM,	an quote brake parts fro		
Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply	First Offer - 15.00%	1 / each	15.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: 15% Time of Order. Current Prices Available http://www.mohawkmfo	Discount from Current L on our Website:	ist Price in	Effect a
Palm Peterbilt Truck Centers, Inc. [Ad]	First Offer - 15.00%	1 / each	15.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes:	de: Eaton, Bendix Meri	itor, Gunite	
MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY	First Offer - 12.00%	1 / each	12.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: ABC- 12% Off Retail		e	
Agency Notes:		Supplier Notes: ABC- 12% Off Retail	companies Online Store	•	
Agency Notes: Southern Coach Parts Company	First Offer - 10.00%	Supplier Notes: ABC- 12% Off Retail	companies Online Store		Y
Agency Notes: Southern Coach Parts Company Product Code:	First Offer - 10.00%	Supplier Notes: ABC- 12% Off Retail	companies Online Store		Υ
Agency Notes:	First Offer - 10.00%	Supplier Notes: ABC- 12% Off Retail 1 / each Supplier Product Co	companies Online Store	Y	Y
Agency Notes: Southern Coach Parts Company Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Notes: ABC- 12% Off Retail 1 / each Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes:	10.00% de: 10.00% de:	Y	Y
Southern Coach Parts Company Product Code: Agency Notes: THE AFTERMARKET PARTS COMPANY, LLC Product Code:		Supplier Notes: ABC- 12% Off Retail 1 / each Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: 1 / each Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Quoting List Less 10% US List Price is Column	10.00% de: 10.00% de:	Y	Y
Southern Coach Parts Company Product Code: Agency Notes: THE AFTERMARKET PARTS COMPANY, LLC Product Code: Agency Notes:	First Offer - 10.00%	Supplier Notes: ABC- 12% Off Retail 1 / each Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: 1 / each Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Quoting List Less 10% US List Price is Column subject to change without	10.00% de: 10.00% de: 10.00% is in count notice.	Y lumn E. ***	Y Prices ar

Agency Notes:		Supplier Notes:			
Invermol LLC [Ad]	First Offer - 2.00%	1 / each	2.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Invermol LLC propose Into the specifications provided the specifications provided the specifications of the specification of the specificatio	nereby to furnish Parts for povided by the bidding pararket products brand M I Asbestos), Brake Shoes by brakes, Rotors and any	arty. Ieritor inclu , Calipers, <i>I</i>	ıding
GILLIG	First Offer - 0.00%	1 / each	0.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes:	ode:		

Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
··	First Offer - 40.00%	1 / each	40.00%	Atten.	Y
Neopart Product Code: Agency Notes:	First Offer - 40.00%	Supplier Product Code Supplier Notes: Manuf Meritor, MGM, MAN, Halde	e: acturer/Aftermark	et Offere	
M&H Automotive	First Offer - 40.00%	1 / each	40.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code Supplier Notes: Manuf		et Offere	d : NAP
Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply	First Offer - 15.00%	1 / each	15.00%		Υ
Agency Notes:		Supplier Notes: Manuf MOHAWK 15% Discount from Curren Current Prices Available or http://www.mohawkmfg.c	t List Price in Effect at n our Website:		
MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY	First Offer - 12.00%	1 / each	10.000/		
	17 Cacii	12.00%		Υ	
		Supplier Product Code Supplier Notes: Manuf Muncie Aftermarket ABC-companies Online Sto 12% Off Retail	e: acturer/Aftermark	et Offere	-
Product Code: Agency Notes: Southern Coach Parts Company	First Offer - 10.00%	Supplier Product Code Supplier Notes: Manuf Muncie Aftermarket ABC-companies Online Sto	e: acturer/Aftermark	et Offere	-

THE AFTERMARKET PARTS COMPANY, LLC	First Offer - 10.00%	1 / each	10.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Quoting List Less 10%	nufacturer/Aftermark D, List Less 10% is in col		
Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc [Ad]	First Offer - 10.00%	1 / each	10.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Mar	ode: nufacturer/Aftermark	et Offer	ed:VMP
Manuel Gomez & Associates, Inc	First Offer - 9.00%	1 / each	9.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Mar Meritor	ode: nufacturer/Aftermark	et Offer	ed∶
Midwest Bus Corporation	First Offer - 5.00%	1 / each	5.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Mar Meritor	ode: nufacturer/Aftermark	et Offer	ed: MGM
GILLIG	First Offer - 0.00%	1 / each	0.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Mar	ode: nufacturer/Aftermark	et Offer	ed: GILLIG

Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs	
JANEK CORP	First Offer - 100.00%	1 / each	100.00%	Υ	Υ	
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes:				
Manuel Gomez & Associates, Inc	First Offer - 16.00%	1 / each	16.00%		Υ	
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code Supplier Notes:	e:			
Neopart	First Offer - 15.00%	1 / each	15.00%		Υ	
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code Supplier Notes: Americ USSC, QStraint		One, Freed	lman,	
Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply	First Offer - 15.00%	1 / each	15.00%		Υ	
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code Supplier Notes: 15% D Time of Order. Current Prices Available o http://www.mohawkmfg.o	iscount from Current n our Website:	List Price ir	n Effect a	
MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY	First Offer - 12.00%	1 / each	12.00%		Υ	
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code Supplier Notes: ABC-co 12% Off Retail		e		

THE AFTERMARKET PARTS COMPANY, LLC	First Offer - 10.00%	1 / each	10.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Quoting List Less 10% US List Price is Column subject to change with	D, List Less 10% is in co	olumn E. **	*Prices are
Midwest Bus Corporation	First Offer - 5.00%	1 / each	5.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes:	ode:		
Southern Coach Parts Company	First Offer - 0.00%	1 / each	0.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: No Bid	ode:		
GILLIG	First Offer - 0.00%	1 / each	0.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes:	ode:		
Palm Peterbilt Truck Centers, Inc. [Ad]	First Offer - 0.00%	1 / each	0.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes:	ode:		

Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs	
Neopart	First Offer - 25.00%	1 / each	25.00%		Υ	
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes:				
Manuel Gomez & Associates, Inc	First Offer - 16.00%	1 / each	16.00%		Υ	
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Coo Supplier Notes:	de:			
Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply	First Offer - 15.00%	1 / each	15.00%		Υ	
		Current Prices Available http://www.mohawkmfg				
	First Offer - 12.00%	1 / each	12.00%		Υ	
Product Code:	First Offer - 12.00%		12.00%	•	Y	
MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY Product Code: Agency Notes: THE AFTERMARKET PARTS COMPANY, LLC	First Offer - 12.00%	1 / each Supplier Product Coc Supplier Notes: ABC-c	12.00%	Y	Y	

Agency Notes:	Supplier Notes: Quoting List Less 10% US List Price is Column subject to change witho	D, List Less 10% is in colout notice.	umn E. ***	Prices are	
Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc [Ad]	First Offer - 10.00%	1 / each	10.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes:	de:		
Palm Peterbilt Truck Centers, Inc. [Ad]	First Offer - 10.00%	1 / each	10.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes:	de:		
Applied Graphics Itd.	First Offer - 5.00%	1 / each	5.00%		Υ
		Column Pricing Offered 40'Gillig,40'Nabi,42'Nabi itemized parts pricing lis	,45'MCI,& 60'New Flyer g	raphics kit	s &
Midwest Bus Corporation	First Offer - 5.00%	1 / each	5.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes:	de: Bike Racks		
Southern Coach Parts Company	First Offer - 0.00%	1 / each	0.00%		
Product Code:				Υ	Υ
Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: No E		Ť	Y
	First Offer - 0.00%			Y	Y

TDN044F00FD4 04 00 Parts Flashrical all Company									
TRN2115605B101-22 Parts Electrical,	all Components								
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs				
JANEK CORP	First Offer - 100.00%	1 / each	100.00%	Υ	Υ				
Product Code:		Supplier Product Co	ode:						
Agency Notes:		Supplier Notes:							
M&H Automotive	First Offer - 40.00%	1 / each	40.00%		Υ				
Product Code:		Supplier Product Co	ode:						
Agency Notes:		Supplier Notes:							
Neopart	First Offer - 25.00%	1 / each	25.00%		Υ				
Product Code:		Supplier Product Code:							
Agency Notes:		Supplier Notes:							
Manuel Gomez & Associates, Inc	First Offer - 21.00%	1 / each	21.00%		Υ				
Product Code:	_	Supplier Product Code:							
Agency Notes:		Supplier Notes:							
Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply	First Offer - 15.00%	1 / each	15.00%		Υ				
Product Code:		Supplier Product Co	ode:						

Agency Notes:			Time of Order. Current Prices Available http://www.mohawkmi	fg.com	ist Price i	
MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY	First Offer -	12.00%	1 / each	12.00%		Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:			Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: ABC 12% Off Retail	ode: -companies Online Store	•	
THE AFTERMARKET PARTS COMPANY, LLC	First Offer -	10.00%	1 / each	10.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:			Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Quoting List Less 10% US List Price is Column subject to change with	D, List Less 10% is in col	umn E. ** ¹	*Prices are
Electric Sales&Service,Inc	First Offer -	10.00%	1 / each	10.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:			Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Delco,CENiehoff,ENgin			
Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc [Ad]	First Offer -	10.00%	1 / each	10.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:			Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes:	ode:		
Palm Peterbilt Truck Centers, Inc. [Ad]	First Offer -	10.00%	1 / each	10.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:			Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes:	ode:		
Midwest Bus Corporation	First Offer	- 5.00%	1 / each	5.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:			Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes:	ode: EMP		
Southern Coach Parts Company	First Offer	- 0.00%	1 / each	0.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:			Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: No Bid	ode:		
GILLIG	First Offer	- 0.00%	1 / each	0.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:			Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes:	ode:		
Kirk's Automotive Inc.	First Offer	- 0.00%	1 / each	0.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:			Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes:	ode:		
Kirk's Automotive Inc.	Alt 1	- 0.00%	1 / each	0.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:			Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: Ametek Pricing			

Kirk's Automotive Inc.	Alt 2 - 0.00%	1 / each	0.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code:		Supplier Product Cod	de:		
Agency Notes:		Supplier Notes:			
		CE Niehoff Pricing			

Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Neopart	First Offer - 17.00%	1 / each	17.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes:	de:		
Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply	First Offer - 15.00%	1 / each	15.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: 15% Time of Order. Current Prices Available http://www.mohawkmf	Discount from Current le on our Website:	List Price in	Effect at
MUNCIE TRANSIT SUPPLY	First Offer - 12.00%	1 / each	12.00%		Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes: ABC- 12% Off Retail		e	
THE AFTERMARKET PARTS COMPANY, LLC	First Offer - 10.00%	1 / each	10.00%	Υ	Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Cc Supplier Notes: Quo US List Price is Column subject to change without	ting List Less 10% D, List Less 10% is in co	lumn E. ***	Prices are
GILLIG	First Offer - 0.00%	1 / each	0.00%		Υ
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Co Supplier Notes:	ode:		

Supplier Totals

f Neopart		\$0.00 (23/23 items)		
Bid Contact Mitch Smucker MSmucker@neoparttransit.com Ph 888-332-2606		Address 5 Dutch Court Reading, PA 19608		
Supplier Code	vC0000043788			
Agency Note	9S:	Supplier Notes:	Head Attch:	
f GILLIG		\$0.00 (23/23 items)		
g	Gabriel Avila gavila@gillig.com Ph 877-264- 4800	Address 25800 Clawiter Rd Hayward, CA 94545		
Agency Note	98:	Supplier Notes:	Head Attch:	
f MUNCIE T	RANSIT SUPPLY	\$0.00 (23/23 ite	ems)	
F	Karen Louck klouck@abc-companies.com Ph 765-216-3287 Fax 765-213-3325	Address 3720 SOUTH MADISON STRE MUNCIE, IN 47302	ET	

TRN2115605B1

Broward County Board of County Commissioners

Bid Notes **ABC-companies Online Store** 12% Off Retail **Completed Buy America Certification Attached Agency Notes:** Supplier Notes: Head ABC-companies Online Store Attch: 12% Off Retail Completed Buy America Certification Attached f Mohawk Manufacturing and Supply \$0.00 (23/23 items) Bid Contact Terrance mueliner Address 7200 N Oak Park Avenue tmuellner@mohawkmfg.com Niles, IL 60714 Ph 630-408-9731 **Agency Notes:** Supplier Notes: Head Attch: f THE AFTERMARKET PARTS COMPANY, LLC \$0.00 (23/23 items) Bid Contact CONTRACT PARTS Address 3229 SAWMILL PARKWAY DELAWARE, OH 43015 newflyerparts@newflyer.com Ph 800-655-2637 Bid Notes **Quoting List Less 10%** US List Price is Column D, List Less 10% is in column E. ***Prices are subject to change without notice. **Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:** Head Quoting List Less 10% Attch: US List Price is Column D, List Less 10% is in column E. ***Prices are subject to change without notice. EXPERT DIESEL [Ad] \$0.00 (1/23 items) Address 4700 OAKES ROAD Bid Contact karen putter SUITE G kp@cumminsexpert.com Ph 954-583-2400 **DAVIE, FL 33314** Agency Notes: **Supplier Notes:** Manuel Gomez & Associates, Inc \$0.00 (11/23 items) Bid Contact Manuel Gomez Address 2239 NW 3rd ST ManuelGomezandAssociates@gmail.com Miami, FL 33125 Ph 786-542-0129 Qualifications MBE SB Agency Notes: **Supplier Notes:** \$0.00 (1/23 items) Invermol LLC [Ad] Bid Contact Rafael E Molina Address 2658 nw 97th ave info@invermol.com Doral, FL 33172 Ph 786-409-2125 Agency Notes: **Supplier Notes:** Sutrak USA \$0.00 (1/23 items) Bid Contact Amy Ascani Address COMMERCE CITY, CO 80022 aascani@sutrakusa.com Ph 303-287-2700 **Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:** Lou Bachrodt Freightliner \$0.00 (3/23 items) Bid Contact Chris Poulin Address POMPANO BEACH, FL 33064 cpoulin@loubachrodt.com Ph 954-545-1000

TRN2115605B1

Broward County Board of County Commissioners

Fax 954-582-4102 Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Midwest Bus Corporation \$0.00 (13/23 items) Address 1940 W. Stewart St. Bid Contact Joe Yoon sales@midwestbus.com Owosso, MI 48867 Ph 989-723-5241 Fax 989-725-5404 Supplier Code VC0000014188 Agency Notes: **Supplier Notes:** MCI Service Parts, Inc. [Ad] \$0.00 (2/23 items) Address 7001 Universal Coach Drive Bid Contact Sharon Marra Louisville, KY 40258 partsbids@mcicoach.com Ph 502-318-3252 Agency Notes: **Supplier Notes:** Southern Coach Parts Company \$0.00 (22/23 items) Address 1818 Merchants Dr **Bid Contact** Herman Bolden socoach@bellsouth.net Birmingham, AL 35244 Ph 205-988-8989 Fax 205-988-8981 Supplier Code VC0000030604 Qualifications SB **Agency Notes:** Supplier Notes: Kirk's Automotive Inc. \$0.00 (9/23 items) **Bid Contact** Al Benish Address 9330 Roselawn rrk@kirksauto.com Detroit, MI 48204 Ph 313-933-7030 Supplier Code VC0000014101 Supplier Notes: Agency Notes: JANEK CORP \$0.00 (13/23 items) **Bid Contact CHRIS APGAR** Address PO BOX 904 CAPGAR@EJANEK.COM **TUCKERTON, NJ 08087** Ph 609-294-1884 Supplier Code VC0000008005 **Supplier Notes:** Agency Notes: Applied Graphics Itd. \$0.00 (1/23 items) **Bid Contact Natalie Beckert** Address 1717 McCarrick Parkway NATALIE@AGLTD.ORG Mansfield, OH 44903 Ph 419-571-0744 Qualifications DBE SB WBE Bid Notes There are 5 different graphics packages 40'Gillig,40'Nabi,42'Nabi,45'MCI,& 60'New Flyer graphics kits & itemized parts pricing list available. Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: There are 5 different graphics packages 40'Gillig,40'Nabi,42'Nabi,45'MCI,& 60'New Flyer graphics kits & itemized parts pricing list available. **Dartco Transmission** \$0.00 (2/23 items) Address 2830 E. Gretta Lane Bid Contact Barry Jeshurin bjeshurin@dartcotransmission.com Anaheim, CA 92806 Ph 714-237-0911

	Fax 714-237-0917			
Agency Not	tes:	Supplier Notes:		
Electric Sa Bid Contact	ales&Service,Inc Ray Ibberson essmiami@aol.com Ph 305-754-8646	Address 340 NE 75 th Street Miami, FL 33138	\$0.00	(5/23 items
	le VC0000020086			
Agency Not	les:	Supplier Notes:		
M&H Auto			\$0.00	(6/23 items
	Keith Dayringer keith_mhnapa@bellsouth.net	Address 3560 W Broward Blvd Fort Lauderdale, FL 33312		
	List prices available at website, www.NAPAPROLINK.com			
Agency Not	tes:	Supplier Notes: List prices available at website, www.NAPAPROLINK.com		
EVERGLA	DES DIESEL INJECTION SERVICE, INC.	\$	0.00	(12/23 items
Bid Contact	WILLIAM GONZALEZ Admin@evergladesdiesel.com Ph 954-522-1780 Fax 954-522-1781	Address 243 SW 33rd COURT FORT LAUDERDALE, FL	. 33315	
Supplier Cod	le VC0000021101			
Agency Not	tes:	Supplier Notes:		
Reliable T	ransmission Service, Inc.		\$0.00	(1/23 item
	Rebecca Mann rebeccam@rtsallison.com Ph 813-677-8883	Address 6613 78th St. South Riverview, FL 33578		
Agency Not	tes:	Supplier Notes:		
Palm Pete	erbilt Truck Centers, Inc. [Ad]		\$0.00	(9/23 item
Bid Contact	Tricia A Wetherington tgarcia@palmtruck.com Ph 954-584-3200 Fax 954-584-3228	Address 2441 S. State Road 7 Fort Lauderdale, FL 333	317	
Supplier Cod	le VC0000021772			
Agency Not	tes:	Supplier Notes:		
Thermo K	ing Miami		\$0.00	(1/23 item
	Hal Taylor ctaylor@tkmiami.com Ph 305-633-0585	Address MIAMI, FL 33142		
Agency Not	tes:	Supplier Notes:		
Stewart & Diesel Allis	Stevenson FDDA LLC d/b/a Florida Detroit on [Ad]		\$0.00	(5/23 item
	Alice Sabin a.sabin@ssss.com Ph 954-327-4440 Fax 954-327-4509	Address 4141 S.W. 30th Avenue Fort Lauderdale, FL 333	12	
Agency Not	tes:	Supplier Notes:		

Exhibit 1 Page 36 of 37

ounty Board of TRN2115605B1

Address 3595 N. Dixie Hwy., Bay # 7

Boca Raton, FL 33431

Broward County Board of County Commissioners

Bid Contact Penny Brooks

sales@vmpparts.com

Ph 561-362-6080 Fax 561-362-7994

Qualifications WBE

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

CUMMINS SALES AND SERVICE \$0.00 (1/23 items)

Bid Contact JOSE RODRIGUEZ Address HIALEAH, FL 33014

JOSE.RODRIGUEZ@CUMMINS.COM

Ph 305-824-4604

Bid Notes Access to QSOL(Quickserve) / Web Parts online pricing is available thru QSOL administrator.

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes:

Access to QSOL(Quickserve) / Web Parts online pricing is

available thru QSOL administrator.

* *

No Bids

Amano McGann, Inc. do not offer automotive services

Bennett Auto Supply We are unable to furnish the parts for this solicitation.

Voith Turbo, Inc. Voith is unable to meet the terms and conditions of the bid.

Weller Truck Parts Weller Truck does not sell individual Allison parts, only complete transmissions.