



Price Analysis

Bid No. GEN2115390B1
 Rack Cooling System and UPS Preventive Maintenance and Repairs
 Agency: Transit Division
 Purchasing Agent: Melissa Cuevas

Date Bid Posted: 12/01/17
 Date Bid Opened: 01/05/18
 Bid Submittals: 3
 Declinations: 0

No. Item	Qty	Unit	Keystone CSA		Percent Difference to ICE	ARM Electrical Services LLC		Percent Difference to ICE	"D" Electrician Technical Services Inc		Percent Difference to ICE	Independent Cost Estimate (ICE)	
			Price	Total		Price	Total		Price	Total		Price	Total
1	2	each	\$29,918.00	\$59,836.00	-5%	\$39,255.00	\$78,510.00	25%	\$58,235.00	\$116,470.00	85%	\$31,500	\$63,000
2	1	lps	NO BID	NO BID	N/A	\$1,700.00	\$1,700.00	-43%	\$6,000.00	\$6,000.00	100%	\$2,998	\$2,998.00
3	2	each	\$940.00	\$1,880.00	-69%	\$850.00	\$1,700.00	-72%	\$2,400.00	\$4,800.00	-20%	\$2,998	\$5,996.00
4	2	each	\$875.00	\$1,750.00	-3%	\$900.00	\$1,800.00	0%	\$3,100.00	\$6,200.00	244%	\$900	\$1,800
5	128	each	NO BID	NO BID	N/A	\$11.71	\$1,498.88	34%	\$170.00	\$21,760.00	1843%	\$8.75	\$1,120
6	128	each	NO BID	NO BID	N/A	\$15.00	\$1,920.00	0%	\$65.00	\$8,320.00	333%	\$15.00	\$1,920.00
7	1000	hr	\$110.00	\$110,000.00	5%	\$115.00	\$115,000.00	10%	\$95.00	\$95,000.00	-10%	\$105.00	105,000.00
8	1000	hr	\$165.00	\$165,000.00	5%	\$172.50	\$172,500.00	10%	\$135.00	\$135,000.00	-14%	\$157.50	\$157,000.00
9	50	hr	NO BID	NO BID	N/A	\$460.00	\$23,000.00	0%	\$360.00	\$18,000.00	-22%	\$460.00	\$23,000
TOTAL				\$ 338,466.00	-6%		\$ 397,628.88	10%		\$411,550.00	14%		\$ 361,834.00

Keystone CSA withdrew their proposal
 Green shading indicates price is less than 15% less than estimate.
 Red shading indicates price is more than 15% less than estimate.