Broward County Board of Exhibit 1Z22113907B1
County Commissioners Page 1 of 10

Bid #22113907B1 - Aircraft Rescue and Fire Fighting Trucks

Creation Date Apr 26, 2017 End Date Jun 16, 2017 2:00:00 PM EDT

Start Date May 15, 2017 10:50:22 AM EDT Awarded Date Not Yet Awarded

Z2113907B1--01-01 Group 1 - Aircraft Rescue and Fire Fighting Trucks : Aircraft Rescue and Fire Fighting Truck
Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. | Docs
Rosenbauer [Ad] First Offer - $914,077.00 | 2/each $1,828,154.00 Y Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes
or No): 1year

Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 360
Panther 6x6 HRET

Agency Notes:

Oshkosh Corporation, Airport Products Division||First Offer - $1,018,093.00 | 2/each | $2,036,186.00 | Y | Y

Product Code: Supplier Product Code:

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes
or No): Yes

Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 300
2018 Oshkosh Striker 6x6 ARFF Vehicle

Z2113907B1--02-01 Group 2 - Optional Items: Ladder, Type 1A

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs

Rosenbauer [Ad] First Offer - $695.00 | 1/each $695.00 Y

Product Code: Supplier Product Code: 1

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or No):
1 year

Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 360

Oshkosh Corporation, Airport Products Division | |First Offer - $877.00 | 1/each $877.00 | | v
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or No):
Yes
Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 300
Z2113907B1--02-02 Group 2 - Optional Items: Air Tools-Chisels, Cutting and Case
Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs
Oshkosh Corporation, Airport Products Division | [First Offer - $1,805.00 | 1/each $1,805.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code:
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or
No): Yes
Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 300
Rosenbauer [Ad] | |First Offer - $2,010.00 | 1/each $2,010.00 | | v
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Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Broward County Board of

County Commissioners Page 2 of 10

Supplier Product Code: 2

Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or
No): 1 year

Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 360
AJAX 911 super duty kit (priced as each)

Z2113907B1--02-03 Group 2 - Optional Items: Crash Axe

Supplier

Unit Price

Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs

Rosenbauer [Ad]

First Offer - $165.00

1/each $165.00 Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 3

Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or No):
1 year

Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 360

Small non wedge serrated (priced as each)

Oshkosh Corporation, Airport Products Division | |First Offer - $185.00

1/each $185.00 | | v

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or No):
Yes

Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 300

Z2113907B1--02-04 Group 2 - Optional Items: Seat Belt Cutters

Supplier

Unit Price

Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs

Rosenbauer [Ad]

First Offer - $52.00

1/each $52.00 Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 4

Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or No):
1 year

Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 360

(priced as each)

Oshkosh Corporation, Airport Products Division | |First Offer - $56.00

1/ each $56.00 | | v

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or No):
Yes

Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 300

Z2113907B1--02-05 Group 2 - Optional Items: Sledge Hammer Combo Axe

Supplier

Unit Price

Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs

Rosenbauer [Ad]

First Offer - $0.00

1/each $0.00 Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 5

Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or No): 0

Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 0
NO BID on this item

Z2113907B1--02-06 Group 2 - Optional Iltems: Hand Held Fler K53 Camera and Truck Mounted Charger
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Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs
Rosenbauer [Ad] First Offer - $5,900.00 | 1/each $5,900.00 Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 6
Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or

No): 1 YEAR
Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 360

Z2113907B1--02-07 Group 2 - Optional ltems: Crash Kit
Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs
Rosenbauer [Ad] First Offer - $0.00 | 1/each $0.00 Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 7
Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or No):0

Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 0
NO BID ON THIS ITEM

ets of ARFF Bunker Gear

Z2113907B1--02-08 Group 2 - Optional Iltems: Complete S
Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs
Rosenbauer [Ad] First Offer - $0.00 | 6/each $0.00 Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 8
Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or No): 0
Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 0
NO BID ON THIS ITEM

Z2113907B1--02-09 Group 2 - Optional ltems: 1/2 Inch Reversible Air Drill
Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs
Rosenbauer [Ad] First Offer - $250.00 | 1/each $250.00 Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 9
Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or No):

1 YEAR
Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 360

(priced as each)

Z2113907B1--02-10 Group 2 - Optional Items: Icom IC-A6 with BP-210N Battery
Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs
Rosenbauer [Ad] First Offer - $663.00 | 1/each $663.00 Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 9
Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or No):

1 YEAR
Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 360

(priced as each)

Group 2 - Optional Items: CM166 Master Charger for Icom IC-A6 Installed

Z2113907B1--02-11
Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs
Rosenbauer [Ad] First Offer - $230.00 | 1/each $230.00 Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 10

1YEAR
Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 360

(priced as each)

Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or No):

6/16/2017
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Z2113907B1--02-12 Group 2 - Optional Items: 5-Year Bumper to Bumper Warranty
Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs
Rosenbauer [Ad] First Offer - $41,160.00 | 1/each $41,160.00 Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 11
Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or

No): 1 YEAR
Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 360
(priced as each)THIS IS FOR 4 ADDL YEARS FOR A TOTAL OF 5

YEARS

Oshkosh Corporation, Airport Products Division | |First Offer - $55,668.00

1/ each | $55,668.00 | | v

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or
No): Yes

Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 300

Z2113907B1--02-13 Group 2 - Optional Items: Skin Penetrator Agent Applicator Tool (SPAAT) (Paratech Airgun SC)

Agency Notes:

S

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs
Rosenbauer [Ad] First Offer - $6,500.00 | 1/each $6,500.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: 12

upplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or

No): 1 YEAR
Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 360
(priced as each)

Z2113907B1--02-14 Group 2 - Optional Items: Battery Operated Multi-Use Hydraulic Tool

Supplier

Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs

Rosenbauer [Ad]

First Offer - $0.00 | 1/

each $0.00 Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Del

Supplier Product Code: 13
Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or No):0

ivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 0

NO BID ON THIS ITEM

Z2113907B1--02-15 Group 2 - Optional Items: Truck Rental from Receipt of Purchase Order to Delivery of New

Truck
Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs
Rosenbauer [Ad] First Offer - $0.00 | 1/each $0.00 Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Del
NO

Supplier Product Code: 12
Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or No): 0

ivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 0
BID ON THIS ITEM

Z2113907B1--02-16 Group 2 - Optional Items: Light Tower

Supplier

Unit Price

Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs

Rosenbauer [Ad]

First Offer - $12,516.00

1/each $12,516.00 Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 13

Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or
No): 1 YEAR

Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 360
(priced as each) COMMAND LIGHT KL-450

Oshkosh Corporation, Airport Products Division | |First Offer - $30,357.00

1/ each | $30,357.00 | | v

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

6/16/2017
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Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 300

Z2113907B1--02-17 Group 2 - Optional ltems: Axes

Supplier

Unit Price

Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs

Rosenbauer [Ad]

First Offer - $78.00

2/ each $156.00 Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 14

Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or No):
1YEAR

Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 360

(priced as each) 6 LB FLAT HEAD

Z2113907B1--02-18 Group 2 - Optional Items: Blanket

Supplier

Unit Price

Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs

Rosenbauer [Ad]

First Offer - $103.00

2/ each $206.00 Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 15
Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or No):

1 YEAR
Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 360

(priced as each)

Z2113907B1--02-19 Group 2 - Optional Items: Chocks, Aluminum 8 Inch

Supplier

Unit Price

Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs

Rosenbauer [Ad]

First Offer - $135.00

$270.00 Y

2/ each

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 16
Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or No):

1 YEAR
Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 360

(priced as each)

Z2113907B1--02-20 Group 2 - Optional Items: Cutter, Bolt, 36 Inch (Fire Service)

Supplier

Unit Price

Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs

Rosenbauer [Ad]

First Offer - $175.00

1/each $175.00 Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 16
Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or No):

1 YEAR
Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 360
(priced as each)

Group 2 - Optional Items: Cutter, Cable, Aircraft

Z2113907B1--02-21
Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs
Rosenbauer [Ad] First Offer - $278.00 | 1/each $278.00 Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 17
Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or No):
1 YEAR

Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 360
(priced as each)

Z2113907B1--02-22 Group 2 - Optional Items: Pry Bar, 60 Inch

Supplier

Unit Price

Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs

Rosenbauer [Ad]

First Offer - $78.00

1/each $78.00 Y

Product Code:

6/16/2017
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Agency Notes:
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Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or No):
1 YEAR

Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 360

(priced as each)

Z2113907B1--02-23 Group 2 - Optional ltems: Hammer, Sledge, 8 Pound

Supplier

Unit Price

Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs

Rosenbauer [Ad]

First Offer - $67.00

1/each $67.00 Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 19

Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or No):
1YEAR

Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 360

(priced as each)

Z2113907B1--02-24 Group 2 - Optional Items: Hook, Assault Grapnel, 3 Hooks, 2 Pound

Supplier

Unit Price

Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs

Rosenbauer [Ad]

First Offer - $70.00

1/each $70.00 Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 20

Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or No):
1YEAR

Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 360

(priced as each)

Z2113907B1--02-25 Group 2 - Optional Items: Pike Pole, 8 Foot with Fiberglass Handle

Supplier

Unit Price

Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs

Rosenbauer [Ad]

First Offer - $98.00

1/each $98.00 Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 21

Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or No):
1YEAR

Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 360

(priced as each)

Z2113907B1--02-26 Group 2 - Optional Items: Power Rescue Saw

Supplier

Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs

Rosenbauer [Ad]

First Offer - $1,545.00 | 1/each

$1,545.00 Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 22

Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or
No): 1 YEAR

Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 360
k1250 (priced as each)

Z2113907B1--02-27 Group 2 - Optional ltems: Wrench, Adjustable, 8 Inch

Supplier

Unit Price

Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs

Rosenbauer [Ad]

First Offer - $17.00

1/each $17.00 Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 23

Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or No):
1YEAR

Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 360

(priced as each)

Z2113907B1--02-28 Group 2 - Optional Items: Hooligan Tool with Standard Claw

Supplier

6/16/2017
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Rosenbauer [Ad] ||First Offer - $143.00 | 1/each $143.00 | | Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: 24
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or No):
1 YEAR

Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 360
(priced as each)

Z2113907B1--02-29 Group 2 - Optional Items: Shovel, D Handle, Round Point

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs
Rosenbauer [Ad] First Offer - $48.00 | 1/each $48.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: 25
Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or No):
1YEAR
Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 360
(priced as each)

Z2113907B1--02-30 Group 2 - Optional Iltems: 6.5 HP with 10.5 kpa PS| Twin Flow Power Unit

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs
Rosenbauer [Ad] First Offer - $0.00 | 1/each $0.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: 26

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or No):0

Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 0
NO BID ON THIS ITEM

Z2113907B1--02-31 Group 2 - Optional Items: S-200-24 Spreader

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs
Rosenbauer [Ad] First Offer - $0.00 | 1/each $0.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: 27

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or No):0

Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 0
NO BID ON THIS ITEM

Z2113907B1--02-32 Group 2 - Optional Items: TLS 50

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs
Rosenbauer [Ad] First Offer - $0.00 | 1/each $0.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: 28

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or No): 0

Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 0
NO BID ON THIS ITEM

Z2113907B1--02-33 Group 2 - Optional Items: TLS 40 RAM

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs
Rosenbauer [Ad] First Offer - $0.00 | 1/each $0.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: 29

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or No):0

Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days):0
NO BID ON THIS ITEM

Z2113907B1--02-34 Group 2 - Optional Items: Scott 4.5 AP75 with CBRN/SEM/DEDSS

Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs
Rosenbauer [Ad] First Offer - $0.00 | 4/each $0.00 Y
Product Code: Supplier Product Code: 30

Agency Notes: Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or No):0
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Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 0
NO BID ON THIS ITEM

Z2113907B1--02-35 Group 2 - Optional Iltems: Scott 45 Min. bottles @4500 PSI

Supplier

Unit Price

Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs

Rosenbauer [Ad]

First Offer - $0.00

8/ each $0.00 Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 31

Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or No): 0
Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 0

NO BID ON THIS ITEM

Z2113907B1--02-36 Group 2 - Optional Items: AV3000 HT Face Piece LARGE

Supplier

Unit Price

Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs

Rosenbauer [Ad]

First Offer - $0.00

6/ each $0.00 Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 32
Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or No):0
Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days):0
NO BID ON THIS ITEM

Z2113907B1--02-37 Group 2 - Optional Items: AV3000 HT

Face Piece MEDIUM

Supplier

Unit Price

Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs

Rosenbauer [Ad]

First Offer - $0.00

2/ each $0.00 Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 33
Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or No):0
Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days):0
NO BID ON THIS ITEM

Z2113907B1--02-38 Group 2 - Optional Items: PAK Tracker #200266-03 with Truck Charger #200433-01

Supplier

Unit Price

Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs

Rosenbauer [Ad]

First Offer - $0.00

1/each $0.00 Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 34
Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or No):0
Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days):0
NO BID ON THIS ITEM

Z2113907B1--02-39 Group 2 - Optional Items: RIT Pak 11 200954-02

Supplier

Unit Price

Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs

Rosenbauer [Ad]

First Offer - $0.00

1/each $0.00 Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 35
Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or No):0
Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days):0
NO BID ON THIS ITEM

Z2113907B1--02-40 Group 2 - Optional Items: Rl Amp Assembly 200261-0

Supplier

Unit Price

Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs

Rosenbauer [Ad]

First Offer - $0.00

4 | each $0.00 Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 36
Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or No):0
Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days):0
NO BID ON THIS ITEM

6/16/2017
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Z2113907B1--02-41 Group 2 - Optional Items: Rl Lapel Assembly 200262-02
Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs
Rosenbauer [Ad] First Offer - $0.00 | 4/each $0.00 Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 37

NO BID ON THIS ITEM

Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or No):0
Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 0

Z2113907B1--02-42 Group 2 - Optional Iltems: Hose & Socket Assembly #804335-14

Supplier

Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price

Attch.

Docs

Rosenbauer [Ad]

First Offer - $0.00 | 4 /each $0.00

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 38

NO BID ON THIS ITEM

Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or No): 0
Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 0

Z2113907B1--02-43 Group 2 - Optional ltems: Simulator

Supplier

Total Price

Unit Price | Qty/Unit

Attch.

Docs

Rosenbauer [Ad]

First Offer - $29,378.00 | 1/each $29,378.00

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 39

Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or

No): 1 YEAR
Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 360
TABLE TOP HRET SIMULATOR
Z2113907B1--02-44 Group 2 - Optional Items: Nozzle
Supplier Unit Price | Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs
Rosenbauer [Ad] First Offer - $0.00 | 1/each $0.00 Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 40

NO BID ON THIS ITEM

Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or No):0
Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days):0

Z2113907B1--02-45 Group 2 - Optional Items: Gate Crash Bar

Supplier

Total Price

Unit Price | Qty/Unit

Attch.

Docs

Rosenbauer [Ad]

First Offer - $0.00 | 1/each $0.00

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 41
No):0

NO BID ON THIS ITEM

Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or

Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days):0

Oshkosh Corporation, Airport Products Division | |First Offer - $1,425.00

1/each $1,425.00 |

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

No): Yes

Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or

Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 300

Z22113907B1--02-46 Group 2 - Optional

Items: Mechanical Steering Provisions for Rearmost Axle

6/16/2017
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Oshkosh Corporation, Airport Products Division | |First Offer - $13,333.00 | 1/each $13,333.00 Y
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Agency Notes:

Page 10 of 10
Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or
No): Yes

Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 300

Rosenbauer [Ad]

| |First Offer - $32,000.00

1/ each $32,000.00 | | v

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 42

Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or
No): 1 YEAR

Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 360
ELECTRIC OVER HYDRAULIC REAR STEERING

Z2113907B1--02-47 Group 2 - Optional Items: Piercing Nozzel Extension

Supplier Unit Price

Qty/Unit Total Price | Attch. Docs

Rosenbauer [Ad] First Offer - $0.00

1/each $0.00 Y

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code: 43

Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or No):
0
Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days):0
NO BID ON THIS ITEM

Oshkosh Corporation, Airport Products Division | |First Offer - $225.00

1/ each $225.00 | | v

Product Code:
Agency Notes:

Supplier Product Code:

Supplier Notes: Meet Warranty Requirements (Yes or No):
Yes

Delivery After Receipt of PO (calendar days): 300

Supplier Totals

f Rosenbauer [Ad]

Bid Contact Tague Johnson
tiohnson@rosenbaueramerica.com
Ph 651-462-1000

Bid Bond "
Agency Notes:

$1,962,824.00 (48/48 items)

Address 5181 260th Street
Wyoming, MN 55092

(Status: An error occurred during verification. Bond Not Found )

Head
Attch:

Supplier Notes:

Oshkosh Corporation, Airport Products Division

Bid Contact Dustin Raddatz
draddatz@airport.oshkoshcorp.com
Ph 920-749-2250

Agency Notes:

$2,140,117.00

Address 3100 N McCarthy Road
Appleton, WI 54913

(10/48 items)

Supplier Notes:

*

as follows:

*
The contract award of $2,028,884.00 is based the purchase of items 1, 12, 16, 43 and 46 from the low bidder Rosenbauer Minnesota, LLC as

Qty Being
Line item Purchased Cost Total
Z2113907B1--01-01 2 $914,077.00 $1,828,154.00
Z2113907B1--02-12 2 $41,160.00 $82,320.00
Z2113907B1--02-16 2 $12,516.00 $25,032.00
Z2113907B1--02-43 1 $29,378.00 $29,378.00
Z2113907B1--02-46 2 $32,000.00 $64,000.00
GRAND TOTAL: $2,028,884.00
6/16/2017 BidSync
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