

**PRICE ANALYSIS**  
**Y2112956B1, Herbicides and Surfactants**

Vendors Listed Alphabetically

| Item # | Item                                                                | Qty | Unit   | Crop Production Services Inc |               | Florida Clear Energy LLC |                           | Glades Formulating Corp |       | Helena Chemical Co        |       |
|--------|---------------------------------------------------------------------|-----|--------|------------------------------|---------------|--------------------------|---------------------------|-------------------------|-------|---------------------------|-------|
|        |                                                                     |     |        | Price                        | Total         | Price                    | Total                     | Price                   | Total | Price                     | Total |
| 1      | Aquatic Herbicide Granular Hydrothol 191 Granular or Approved Equal | 800 | pound  | \$ 3.14                      | \$ 2,512.00   | AWD                      | \$ 3.77 \$ 3,016.00       | NO BID                  |       | \$ 3.52 \$ 2,816.00       |       |
| 2      | Aquatic Herbicide Granular Clipper or Approved Equal                | 400 | pound  | \$ 125.00                    | \$ 50,000.00  |                          | \$ 150.00 \$ 60,000.00    | NO BID                  |       | \$ 108.00 \$ 43,200.00    |       |
| 3      | Aquatic Herbicide Granular Aquathol Super K or Approved Equal       | 700 | pound  | \$ 17.64                     | \$ 12,348.00  | AWD                      | \$ 21.17 \$ 14,819.00     | NO BID                  |       | \$ 17.20 \$ 12,040.00     |       |
| 4      | Aquatic Herbicide Granular Navigate or Approved Equal               | 100 | pound  | \$ 2.96                      | \$ 296.00     | AWD                      | \$ 3.55 \$ 355.00         | NO BID                  |       | \$ 2.94 \$ 294.00         |       |
| 5      | Aquatic Herbicide Granular Copper Sulfate or Approved Equal         | 700 | pound  | \$ 1.24                      | \$ 868.00     | AWD                      | \$ 1.49 \$ 1,043.00       | NO BID                  |       | \$ 1.45 \$ 1,015.00       |       |
| 6      | Aquatic Herbicide Liquid Aquathol K or Approved Equal               | 450 | gallon | \$ 68.40                     | \$ 30,780.00  | AWD                      | \$ 82.08 \$ 36,936.00     | NO BID                  |       | \$ 67.19 \$ 30,235.50     |       |
| 7      | Aquatic Herbicide Liquid Sonar A.S. or Approved Equal               | 60  | gallon | \$ 1,815.00                  | \$ 108,900.00 | AWD                      | \$ 2,178.00 \$ 130,680.00 | NO BID                  |       | \$ 1,739.00 \$ 104,340.00 |       |
| 8      | Aquatic Herbicide Liquid Admiral or Approved Equal                  | 260 | gallon | \$ 25.20                     | \$ 6,552.00   | AWD                      | \$ 30.24 \$ 7,862.40      | NO BID                  |       | \$ 39.24 \$ 10,202.40     |       |
| 9      | Water Conditioning Agent Liquid Quest or Approved Equal             | 60  | gallon | \$ 15.60                     | \$ 936.00     | AWD                      | \$ 18.72 \$ 1,123.20      | NO BID                  |       | \$ 20.30 \$ 1,218.00      |       |
| 10     | Aquatic Herbicide Liquid Sinkerbail or Approved Equal               | 50  | gallon | NO BID                       | \$ -          |                          | NO BID \$ -               | NO BID                  |       | NO BID \$ -               |       |
| 11     | Aquatic Herbicide Liquid Hardball or Approved Equal                 | 15  | gallon | \$ 44.20                     | \$ 663.00     |                          | \$ 53.04 \$ 795.60        | NO BID                  |       | \$ 36.75 \$ 551.25        |       |
| 12     | Spray Adjuvant Liquid Cidekick or Approved Equal                    | 250 | gallon | \$ 16.48                     | \$ 4,120.00   | AWD                      | \$ 19.78 \$ 4,945.00      | NO BID                  |       | \$ 17.71 \$ 4,427.50      |       |
| 13     | Oil Surfactant Liquid Diluent Blue or Approved Equal                | 35  | gallon | NO BID                       | \$ -          |                          | \$ 11.95 \$ 418.25        | NO BID                  |       | \$ 24.00 \$ 840.00        |       |
| 14     | Spray Adjuvant Liquid Cohere or Approved Equal                      | 100 | gallon | \$ 22.50                     | \$ 2,250.00   |                          | \$ 27.00 \$ 2,700.00      | NO BID                  |       | \$ 38.25 \$ 3,825.00      |       |
| 15     | Aquatic Herbicide Liquid Habitat or Approved Equal                  | 60  | gallon | \$ 53.80                     | \$ 3,228.00   | AWD                      | \$ 64.56 \$ 3,873.60      | NO BID                  |       | \$ 52.00 \$ 3,120.00      |       |

**PRICE ANALYSIS**  
**Y2112956B1, Herbicides and Surfactants**

Vendors Listed Alphabetically

| Item #                            | Item                                                               | Qty | Unit   | Crop Production Services<br>Inc |                      | Florida Clear Energy LLC |                      | Glades Formulating<br>Corp |                     | Helena Chemical Co |                      |
|-----------------------------------|--------------------------------------------------------------------|-----|--------|---------------------------------|----------------------|--------------------------|----------------------|----------------------------|---------------------|--------------------|----------------------|
|                                   |                                                                    |     |        | Price                           | Total                | Price                    | Total                | Price                      | Total               | Price              | Total                |
| 16                                | Spray Pattern Indicator Liquid Super Marking Dye or Approved Equal | 80  | gallon | \$ 25.20                        | \$ 2,016.00          | \$ 30.24                 | \$ 2,419.20          | NO BID                     |                     | \$ 20.00           | \$ 1,600.00          |
| 17                                | Aquatic Herbicide Liquid Cutrine Plus or Approved Equal            | 500 | gallon | \$ 14.70                        | \$ 7,350.00          | \$ 17.64                 | \$ 8,820.00          | NO BID                     |                     | \$ 15.50           | \$ 7,750.00          |
| 18                                | Spray Adjuvant Liquid Foam Buster or Approved Equal                | 20  | quart  | \$ 9.20                         | \$ 184.00            | \$ 11.04                 | \$ 220.80            | NO BID                     |                     | \$ 7.75            | \$ 155.00            |
| 19                                | Aquatic Herbicide Liquid Rodeo or Approved Equal                   | 200 | gallon | \$ 15.20                        | \$ 3,040.00          | \$ 18.24                 | \$ 3,648.00          | NO BID                     |                     | \$ 15.50           | \$ 3,100.00          |
| 20                                | Aquatic Herbicide Liquid Reward or Approved Equal                  | 700 | gallon | \$ 38.90                        | \$ 27,230.00         | \$ 46.68                 | \$ 32,676.00         | \$ 45.64                   | \$ 31,948.00        | \$ 37.00           | \$ 25,900.00         |
| 21                                | Aquatic Herbicide Liquid Renovate 3 or Approved Equal              | 35  | gallon | \$ 99.75                        | \$ 3,491.25          | \$ 119.70                | \$ 4,189.50          | NO BID                     |                     | \$ 73.50           | \$ 2,572.50          |
| 22                                | Herbicide Liquid Garlon 4 or Approved Equal                        | 20  | gallon | \$ 53.20                        | \$ 1,064.00          | \$ 63.84                 | \$ 1,276.80          | NO BID                     |                     | \$ 81.00           | \$ 1,620.00          |
| 23                                | Aquatic Herbicide Liquid Hydrothol 191 or Approved Equal           | 250 | gallon | \$ 71.20                        | \$ 17,800.00         | \$ 85.44                 | \$ 21,360.00         | NO BID                     |                     | \$ 70.91           | \$ 17,727.50         |
| 24                                | Spray Adjuvant Liquid PolyAn or Approved Equal                     | 80  | gallon | \$ 32.80                        | \$ 2,624.00          | \$ 39.36                 | \$ 3,148.80          | NO BID                     |                     | \$ 33.18           | \$ 2,654.40          |
| 25                                | Spray Adjuvant Liquid Atmos or Approved Equal                      | 40  | gallon | \$ 21.50                        | \$ 860.00            | \$ 25.80                 | \$ 1,032.00          | NO BID                     |                     | NO BID             | \$ -                 |
| 26                                | Aquatic Herbicide Granular Cutrine Plus Granula or Approved Equal  | 300 | pound  | \$ 2.04                         | \$ 612.00            | \$ 2.45                  | \$ 735.00            | NO BID                     |                     | \$ 2.00            | \$ 600.00            |
| 27                                | Aquatic Herbicide Liquid Green Clean Liquid 5.0 or Approved Equal  | 100 | gallon | \$ 22.60                        | \$ 2,260.00          | \$ 27.12                 | \$ 2,712.00          | NO BID                     |                     | \$ 30.17           | \$ 3,017.00          |
| <b>Total</b>                      |                                                                    |     |        |                                 | <b>\$ 291,984.25</b> |                          | <b>\$ 350,805.15</b> |                            | <b>\$ 31,948.00</b> |                    | <b>\$ 284,821.05</b> |
| <b>Total Vendor Awarded Items</b> |                                                                    |     |        |                                 | <b>\$ 229,896.00</b> |                          |                      |                            |                     |                    |                      |

\*Item not on previous contract, average of all bidder's prices was used for comparison purposes.  
AWD: Recommended for Award

**PRICE ANALYSIS**  
**Y2112956B1, Herbicides and Surfactants**

| Item # | Item                                                                | Qty | Unit   | SiteOne Landscape Supply |                 | Winfield Solutions |                  | Previous Contracts Y1304521B1 Awarded 3/16/15, Y1375104B1 Awarded 9/25/15 |                 | % Difference to Previous Contract Prices |
|--------|---------------------------------------------------------------------|-----|--------|--------------------------|-----------------|--------------------|------------------|---------------------------------------------------------------------------|-----------------|------------------------------------------|
|        |                                                                     |     |        | Price                    | Total           | Price              | Total            | Price                                                                     | Total           | Percent                                  |
| 1      | Aquatic Herbicide Granular Hydrothol 191 Granular or Approved Equal | 800 | pound  | NO BID                   | \$ -            | \$ 3.25            | \$ 2,600.00      | \$ 2.80                                                                   | \$ 2,240.00     | 12%                                      |
| 2      | Aquatic Herbicide Granular Clipper or Approved Equal                | 400 | pound  | \$ 150.87                | \$ 60,348.00    | \$ 105.00          | \$ 42,000.00 AWD | \$ 129.95                                                                 | \$ 51,980.00    | -19%                                     |
| 3      | Aquatic Herbicide Granular Aquathol Super K or Approved Equal       | 700 | pound  | \$ 24.04                 | \$ 16,828.00    | \$ 18.86           | \$ 13,202.00     | \$ 15.79                                                                  | \$ 11,053.00    | 12%                                      |
| 4      | Aquatic Herbicide Granular Navigate or Approved Equal               | 100 | pound  | \$ 3.27                  | \$ 326.60       | \$ 3.50            | \$ 350.00        | \$ 3.24                                                                   | \$ 324.32 *     | -9%                                      |
| 5      | Aquatic Herbicide Granular Copper Sulfate or Approved Equal         | 700 | pound  | \$ 3.30                  | \$ 2,310.00     | \$ 1.40            | \$ 980.00        | \$ 1.45                                                                   | \$ 1,015.00     | -14%                                     |
| 6      | Aquatic Herbicide Liquid Aquathol K or Approved Equal               | 450 | gallon | \$ 88.58                 | \$ 39,861.00    | \$ 73.23           | \$ 32,953.50     | \$ 61.20                                                                  | \$ 27,540.00    | 12%                                      |
| 7      | Aquatic Herbicide Liquid Sonar A.S. or Approved Equal               | 60  | gallon | \$ 3,047.16              | \$ 182,829.60   | \$ 2,000.00        | \$ 120,000.00    | \$ 2,155.83                                                               | \$ 129,349.92 * | -16%                                     |
| 8      | Aquatic Herbicide Liquid Admiral or Approved Equal                  | 260 | gallon | \$ 39.52                 | \$ 10,275.20    | \$ 37.62           | \$ 9,781.20      | \$ 34.36                                                                  | \$ 8,934.64 *   | -27%                                     |
| 9      | Water Conditioning Agent Liquid Quest or Approved Equal             | 60  | gallon | \$ 18.35                 | \$ 1,101.00     | \$ 100.00          | \$ 6,000.00      | \$ 7.59                                                                   | \$ 455.40       | 106%                                     |
| 10     | Aquatic Herbicide Liquid Sinkerbail or Approved Equal               | 50  | gallon | \$ 46.69                 | \$ 2,334.50     | \$ 100.00          | \$ 5,000.00 AWD  | \$ 41.00                                                                  | \$ 2,050.00     | 144%                                     |
| 11     | Aquatic Herbicide Liquid Hardball or Approved Equal                 | 15  | gallon | \$ 46.69                 | \$ 700.35       | \$ 100.00          | \$ 1,500.00 AWD  | \$ 56.14                                                                  | \$ 842.04 *     | 78%                                      |
| 12     | Spray Adjuvant Liquid Cidekick or Approved Equal                    | 250 | gallon | NO BID                   | \$ -            | \$ 17.99           | \$ 4,497.50      | \$ 16.75                                                                  | \$ 4,187.50     | -2%                                      |
| 13     | Oil Surfactant Liquid Diluent Blue or Approved Equal                | 35  | gallon | \$ 49.32                 | \$ 1,726.20     | \$ 13.99           | \$ 489.65 AWD    | \$ 8.79                                                                   | \$ 307.65       | 59%                                      |
| 14     | Spray Adjuvant Liquid Cohere or Approved Equal                      | 100 | gallon | \$ 18.35                 | \$ 1,835.00 AWD | \$ 100.00          | \$ 10,000.00     | \$ 16.75                                                                  | \$ 1,675.00     | 10%                                      |
| 15     | Aquatic Herbicide Liquid Habitat or Approved Equal                  | 60  | gallon | \$ 82.12                 | \$ 4,927.20     | \$ 60.00           | \$ 3,600.00      | \$ 62.50                                                                  | \$ 3,749.76 *   | -14%                                     |

**PRICE ANALYSIS**  
**Y2112956B1, Herbicides and Surfactants**

| Item #                     | Item                                                               | Qty | Unit   | SiteOne Landscape Supply |               | Winfield Solutions |                       | Previous Contracts Y1304521B1 Awarded 3/16/15, Y1375104B1 Awarded 9/25/15 |        | % Difference to Previous Contract Prices |
|----------------------------|--------------------------------------------------------------------|-----|--------|--------------------------|---------------|--------------------|-----------------------|---------------------------------------------------------------------------|--------|------------------------------------------|
|                            |                                                                    |     |        | Price                    | Total         | Price              | Total                 | Price                                                                     | Total  | Percent                                  |
| 16                         | Spray Pattern Indicator Liquid Super Marking Dye or Approved Equal | 80  | gallon | \$ 15.82                 | \$ 1,265.60   | AWD                | \$ 55.00 \$ 4,400.00  | \$ 23.03 \$ 1,842.40                                                      | -31%   |                                          |
| 17                         | Aquatic Herbicide Liquid Cutrine Plus or Approved Equal            | 500 | gallon | \$ 24.60                 | \$ 12,300.00  |                    | \$ 15.99 \$ 7,995.00  | \$ 15.85 \$ 7,925.00                                                      | -7%    |                                          |
| 18                         | Spray Adjuvant Liquid Foam Buster or Approved Equal                | 20  | quart  | \$ 6.42                  | \$ 128.40     | AWD                | \$ 16.00 \$ 320.00    | \$ 6.00 \$ 120.00                                                         | 7%     |                                          |
| 19                         | Aquatic Herbicide Liquid Rodeo or Approved Equal                   | 200 | gallon | \$ 21.20                 | \$ 4,240.00   |                    | \$ 23.00 \$ 4,600.00  | \$ 17.30 \$ 3,460.00                                                      | -12%   |                                          |
| 20                         | Aquatic Herbicide Liquid Reward or Approved Equal                  | 700 | gallon | \$ 47.45                 | \$ 33,215.00  |                    | \$ 79.00 \$ 55,300.00 | \$ 40.00 \$ 28,000.00                                                     | -3%    |                                          |
| 21                         | Aquatic Herbicide Liquid Renovate 3 or Approved Equal              | 35  | gallon | \$ 56.31                 | \$ 1,970.85   | AWD                | \$ 101.74 \$ 3,560.90 | \$ 35.43 \$ 1,240.05                                                      | 59%    |                                          |
| 22                         | Herbicide Liquid Garlon 4 or Approved Equal                        | 20  | gallon | \$ 59.56                 | \$ 1,191.20   |                    | \$ 65.00 \$ 1,300.00  | \$ 52.00 \$ 1,040.00                                                      | 2%     |                                          |
| 23                         | Aquatic Herbicide Liquid Hydrothol 191 or Approved Equal           | 250 | gallon | NO BID                   | \$ -          |                    | \$ 75.35 \$ 18,837.50 | \$ 63.46 \$ 15,865.00                                                     | 12%    |                                          |
| 24                         | Spray Adjuvant Liquid PolyAn or Approved Equal                     | 80  | gallon | \$ 42.04                 | \$ 3,363.20   |                    | \$ 28.00 \$ 2,240.00  | \$ 35.08 \$ 2,806.08                                                      | * -20% |                                          |
| 25                         | Spray Adjuvant Liquid Atmos or Approved Equal                      | 40  | gallon | \$ 12.93                 | \$ 517.20     | AWD                | \$ 32.00 \$ 1,280.00  | \$ 28.00 \$ 1,120.00                                                      | -54%   |                                          |
| 26                         | Aquatic Herbicide Granular Cutrine Plus Granula or Approved Equal  | 300 | pound  | \$ 2.18                  | \$ 654.00     |                    | \$ 2.10 \$ 630.00     | \$ 2.15 \$ 646.20                                                         | * -5%  |                                          |
| 27                         | Aquatic Herbicide Liquid Green Clean Liquid 5.0 or Approved Equal  | 100 | gallon | NO BID                   | \$ -          |                    | \$ 33.99 \$ 3,399.00  | \$ 28.47 \$ 2,847.00                                                      | * -21% |                                          |
| Total                      |                                                                    |     |        |                          | \$ 384,248.10 |                    | \$ 356,816.25         |                                                                           |        |                                          |
| Total Vendor Awarded Items |                                                                    |     |        |                          | \$ 5,717.05   |                    | \$ 51,229.65          |                                                                           |        |                                          |

\*Item not on previous contract, average of all bidder's prices was used for comparison purposes.

AWD: Recommended for Award

**PRICE ANALYSIS**  
**Y2112956B1, Herbicides and Surfactants**

| Item # | Item                                                                | Qty | Unit   | Average<br>Unit Price<br>All Bidders | Sarasota<br>County<br>Awarded<br>2/24/17 | St. Lucie<br>County<br>Awarded<br>1/2017 | Florida Fish<br>and Wildlife<br>Awarded<br>9/2016 |
|--------|---------------------------------------------------------------------|-----|--------|--------------------------------------|------------------------------------------|------------------------------------------|---------------------------------------------------|
|        |                                                                     |     |        | Price                                | Price                                    | Price                                    | Price                                             |
| 1      | Aquatic Herbicide Granular Hydrothol 191 Granular or Approved Equal | 800 | pound  | \$ 3.42                              | NA                                       | NA                                       | NA                                                |
| 2      | Aquatic Herbicide Granular Clipper or Approved Equal                | 400 | pound  | \$ 127.77                            | NA                                       | NA                                       | NA                                                |
| 3      | Aquatic Herbicide Granular Aquathol Super K or Approved Equal       | 700 | pound  | \$ 19.78                             | NA                                       | NA                                       | \$ 16.36                                          |
| 4      | Aquatic Herbicide Granular Navigate or Approved Equal               | 100 | pound  | \$ 3.24                              | NA                                       | NA                                       | \$ 2.76                                           |
| 5      | Aquatic Herbicide Granular Copper Sulfate or Approved Equal         | 700 | pound  | \$ 1.78                              | NA                                       | NA                                       | NA                                                |
| 6      | Aquatic Herbicide Liquid Aquathol K or Approved Equal               | 450 | gallon | \$ 75.90                             | NA                                       | NA                                       | \$ 24.93                                          |
| 7      | Aquatic Herbicide Liquid Sonar A.S. or Approved Equal               | 60  | gallon | \$ 2,155.83                          | \$ 1,940.41                              | NA                                       | NA                                                |
| 8      | Aquatic Herbicide Liquid Admiral or Approved Equal                  | 260 | gallon | \$ 34.36                             | NA                                       | NA                                       | NA                                                |
| 9      | Water Conditioning Agent Liquid Quest or Approved Equal             | 60  | gallon | \$ 34.59                             | NA                                       | NA                                       | NA                                                |
| 10     | Aquatic Herbicide Liquid Sinkerball or Approved Equal               | 50  | gallon | \$ 73.35                             | NA                                       | NA                                       | NA                                                |
| 11     | Aquatic Herbicide Liquid Hardball or Approved Equal                 | 15  | gallon | \$ 56.14                             | NA                                       | NA                                       | NA                                                |
| 12     | Spray Adjuvant Liquid Cidekick or Approved Equal                    | 250 | gallon | \$ 17.99                             | NA                                       | NA                                       | NA                                                |
| 13     | Oil Surfactant Liquid Diluent Blue or Approved Equal                | 35  | gallon | \$ 24.82                             | NA                                       | NA                                       | NA                                                |
| 14     | Spray Adjuvant Liquid Cohere or Approved Equal                      | 100 | gallon | \$ 41.22                             | NA                                       | NA                                       | NA                                                |
| 15     | Aquatic Herbicide Liquid Habitat or Approved Equal                  | 60  | gallon | \$ 62.50                             | \$ 132.50                                | NA                                       | NA                                                |

**PRICE ANALYSIS**  
**Y2112956B1, Herbicides and Surfactants**

| <b>Item #</b> | <b>Item</b>                                                        | <b>Qty</b> | <b>Unit</b> | <b>Average<br/>Unit Price<br/>All Bidders</b> | <b>Sarasota<br/>County<br/>Awarded<br/>2/24/17</b> | <b>St. Lucie<br/>County<br/>Awarded<br/>1/2017</b> | <b>Florida Fish<br/>and Wildlife<br/>Awarded<br/>9/2016</b> |
|---------------|--------------------------------------------------------------------|------------|-------------|-----------------------------------------------|----------------------------------------------------|----------------------------------------------------|-------------------------------------------------------------|
|               |                                                                    |            |             | <b>Price</b>                                  | <b>Price</b>                                       | <b>Price</b>                                       | <b>Price</b>                                                |
| 16            | Spray Pattern Indicator Liquid Super Marking Dye or Approved Equal | 80         | gallon      | \$ 29.25                                      | NA                                                 | \$ 27.00                                           | NA                                                          |
| 17            | Aquatic Herbicide Liquid Cutrine Plus or Approved Equal            | 500        | gallon      | \$ 17.69                                      | NA                                                 | NA                                                 | NA                                                          |
| 18            | Spray Adjuvant Liquid Foam Buster or Approved Equal                | 20         | quart       | \$ 10.08                                      | \$ 6.85                                            | NA                                                 | \$ 4.62                                                     |
| 19            | Aquatic Herbicide Liquid Rodeo or Approved Equal                   | 200        | gallon      | \$ 18.63                                      | \$ 42.50                                           | \$ 22.86                                           | NA                                                          |
| 20            | Aquatic Herbicide Liquid Reward or Approved Equal                  | 700        | gallon      | \$ 49.11                                      | \$ 106.00                                          | NA                                                 | NA                                                          |
| 21            | Aquatic Herbicide Liquid Renovate 3 or Approved Equal              | 35         | gallon      | \$ 90.20                                      | NA                                                 | NA                                                 | NA                                                          |
| 22            | Herbicide Liquid Garlon 4 or Approved Equal                        | 20         | gallon      | \$ 64.52                                      | \$ 136.50                                          | \$ 85.92                                           | NA                                                          |
| 23            | Aquatic Herbicide Liquid Hydrothol 191 or Approved Equal           | 250        | gallon      | \$ 75.73                                      | NA                                                 | NA                                                 | NA                                                          |
| 24            | Spray Adjuvant Liquid PolyAn or Approved Equal                     | 80         | gallon      | \$ 35.08                                      | NA                                                 | NA                                                 | NA                                                          |
| 25            | Spray Adjuvant Liquid Atmos or Approved Equal                      | 40         | gallon      | \$ 23.06                                      | NA                                                 | \$ 25.00                                           | NA                                                          |
| 26            | Aquatic Herbicide Granular Cutrine Plus Granula or Approved Equal  | 300        | pound       | \$ 2.15                                       | NA                                                 | NA                                                 | NA                                                          |
| 27            | Aquatic Herbicide Liquid Green Clean Liquid 5.0 or Approved Equal  | 100        | gallon      | \$ 28.47                                      | NA                                                 | NA                                                 | NA                                                          |
| <b>Total</b>  |                                                                    |            |             |                                               |                                                    |                                                    |                                                             |

**Total Vendor Awarded Items**

\*Item not on previous contract, average of all bidder's prices was used for comparison purposes.

AWD: Recommended for Award