



Date Bid Posted: 1/23/2014
Date Bid Opened: 3/05/2014
Bid Submittals: 2
Declinations: 1

Bid No. V119141481
BUS TIRE LEASING
Agency: Transit Division
Purchasing Agent: Christine Calhoun

Tabulation of Bids			Michelin North America, Inc. One Parkway South Greenville, SC 29615		The Goodyear Tire and Rubber Company 200 Innovation Way D/710 Akron, OH 44316		Bridgestone Americas Tire Operations, LLC 535 Marriott Drive-Mileage Sales Nashville, TN 37214	
Item	MAXIMUM ANNUAL QUANTITY/ UNIT OF MEASURE	Commodity Code Description	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price
Group 1 (Items 1 through 6)								
1	18,000,000 Tire Miles (Mi.)	Year One Lease B305/85R X 22.5 (or equivalent) Load Range "J" Tubeless Bus Tires	\$0.00657	\$ 118,260.00	\$ 0.0099	\$ 178,200.00	No Bid	-
2		Removed from Bid by Addendum 3	-	-	-	-	-	-
3	93,900,000 Tire Miles	Year One Lease B305/70R X 22.5 (or equivalent) Load Range "L" Bus Tires	\$0.00784	\$ 736,176.00	\$ 0.0112	\$ 1,051,680.00	No Bid	-
4	12 Months (Mo.)	Year One Full Service Rate	\$27,625.00	\$ 331,500.00	\$ 28,200.00	\$ 338,400.00	No Bid	-
		SUBTOTAL YEAR ONE		\$ 1,185,936.00 (A)		\$ 1,568,280.00	-	-
5	9,900,000 Tire Miles	Year Two Lease B305/85R X 22.5 (or equivalent) Load Range "J" Tubeless Bus Tires	\$0.00657	\$ 65,043.00	\$ 0.0099	\$ 98,010.00 (A)	No Bid	-
6		Removed from Bid by Addendum 3	-	-	-	-	-	-
7	102,000,000 Tire Miles	Year Two Lease B305/70R X 22.5 (or equivalent) Load Range "L" Bus Tires	\$0.00784	\$ 799,680.00	\$ 0.0112	\$ 1,142,400.00 (A)	No Bid	-
8	12 Months	Year Two Full Service Rate	\$29,025.00	\$ 348,300.00	\$ 30,500.00	\$ 366,000.00	No Bid	-
		SUBTOTAL YEAR TWO		\$ 1,213,023.00 (A)		\$ 1,606,410.00	No Bid	-
TOTAL GROUP 1 (ITEMS 1 THROUGH 6) INITIAL TWO YEAR-TERM				\$ 2,398,959.00		\$ 3,174,690.00 (A)		-

OPTIONAL ITEMS								
1	2,100,000 Tire Miles	Year One Lease 385/55R X 22.5 (or equivalent) Super Single Bus Tires	Removed from Bid by Addendum 3	-	Removed from Bid by Addendum 3	-	Removed from Bid by Addendum 3	-
2	4,200,000 Tire Miles	Year Two Lease 385/55R X 22.5 (or equivalent) Super Single Bus Tires	Removed from Bid by Addendum 3	-	Removed from Bid by Addendum 3	-	Removed from Bid by Addendum 3	-
3	2,500,000 Tire Miles	Year One Lease B315/80R X 22.5 (or equivalent) Bus Tires	\$0.00754	\$ 18,850.00	\$ 0.0056	\$ 14,000.00	No Bid	-
				AWD				
4	5,280,000 Tire Miles	Year Two Lease B315/80R X 22.5 (or equivalent) Bus Tires	\$0.00754	\$ 39,811.20	\$ 0.0058	\$ 30,624.00	No Bid	-
				AWD				
5	4,200,000 Tire Miles	Year Three Lease 385/55R X 22.5 (or equivalent) Super Single Bus Tires	Removed from Bid by Addendum 3		Removed from Bid by Addendum 3		Removed from Bid by Addendum 3	-
6	5,280,000 Tire Miles	Year Three Lease B315/80R X 22.5 (or equivalent) Bus Tires	\$0.00829	\$ 43,771.20	\$ 0.0062	\$ 32,736.00	No Bid	-
				AWD				
7	2,400,000 Tire Miles	Year Three Lease B305/85R X 22.5 (or equivalent) Load Range "J" Tubeless Bus Tires	\$0.00723	\$ 17,352.00	\$ 0.0103	\$ 24,720.00	No Bid	-
				AWD				



Date Bid Posted: 1/23/2014
Date Bid Opened: 3/05/2014
Bid Submittals: 2
Declinations: 1

Bid No. V119141481
BUS TIRE LEASING
Agency: Transit Division
Purchasing Agent: Christine Calhoun

Tabulation of Bids		Michelin North America, Inc. One Parkway South Greenville, SC 29615		The Goodyear Tire and Rubber Company 200 Innovation Way D/710 Akron, OH 44316		Bridgestone Americas Tire Operations, LLC 535 Marriot Drive-Mileage Sales Nashville, TN 37214	
Item	MAXIMUM ANNUAL QUANTITY/ UNIT OF MEASURE	Commodity Code Description	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Total Price
8	115,000,000 Tire Miles	Year Three Lease B305/70R X 22.5 (or equivalent) Load Range "L" Bus Tires	\$0.00862	\$ 991,300.00	\$ 0.0117	\$ 1,345,500.00	-
				AWD			
9	12 Months	Year Three Full Service Rate	\$30,475.00	\$ 365,700.00	\$ 29,920.00	\$ 359,040.00	-
				AWD			
10	4,200,000 Tire Miles	Year Four Lease 385/55R X 22.5 (or equivalent) Super Single Bus Tires	Removed from Bid by Addendum 3		Removed from Bid by Addendum 3		
11	5,280,000 Tire Miles	Year Four Lease B315/80R X 22.5 (or equivalent) Bus Tires	\$0.00912	\$ 48,153.60	\$ 0.0062	\$ 32,736.00	-
				AWD			
12	2,000,000 Tire Miles	Year Four Lease B305/85R X 22.5 (or equivalent) Load Range "J" Tubeless Bus Tires	\$0.00795	\$ 15,900.00	\$ 0.0107	\$ 21,400.00 (A)	-
				AWD			
13	117,400,000 Tire Miles	Year Four Lease B305/70R X 22.5 (or equivalent) Load Range "L" Bus Tires	\$0.00948	\$ 1,112,952.00	\$ 0.0122	\$ 1,432,280.00 (A)	-
				AWD			
14	12 Months	Year Four Full Service Rate	\$32,000.00	\$ 384,000.00	\$ 30,820.00	\$ 369,840.00	-
				AWD			
15	4,200,000 Tire Miles	Year Five Lease 385/55R X 22.5 (or equivalent) Super Single Bus Tires	Removed from Bid by Addendum 3		Removed from Bid by Addendum 3		
16	5,280,000 Tire Miles	Year Five Lease B315/80R X 22.5 (or equivalent) Bus Tires	\$0.01003	\$ 52,958.40	\$ 0.0062	\$ 32,736.00	-
				AWD			
17	2,000,000 Tire Miles	Year Five Lease B305/85R X 22.5 (or equivalent) Load Range "J" Tubeless Bus Tires	\$0.00875	\$ 17,500.00	\$ 0.0112	\$ 22,400.00 (A)	-
				AWD			
18	117,400,000 Tire Miles	Year Five Lease B305/70R X 22.5 (or equivalent) Load Range "L" Bus Tires	\$0.01043	\$ 1,224,482.00	\$ 0.0128	\$ 1,502,720.00 (A)	-
				AWD			
19	12 Months	Year Five Full Service Rate	\$33,600.00	\$ 403,200.00	\$ 31,750.00	\$ 381,000.00	-
				AWD			

Prepared by Suzanne Gabel, 3-6-14
Revised by Christine Calhoun, March 7, 2014
(A) - Corrections in Additions/Extensions for bid tabulation purposes
AWD - Recommended for Award